PLANNING AND ZONING COMMISSION

AGENDA OF A REGULAR MEETING FOR THE PLANNING AND ZONING
COMMISSION OF THE CITY OF PEARLAND, TEXAS, TO BE HELD ON
JUNE 7, 2004 AT 6:30 P.M., IN THE SECOND FLOOR CONFERENCE ROOM
OF CITY HALL, 3519 LIBERTY DRIVE, PEARLAND, TEXAS

I. CALL TO ORDER

IL NEW BUSINESS

A. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION — Remove from table the
Adoption of the 2000 International Building Code, Fire Code and Safety Code.

B. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION —Adoption of the 2000
International Building Code, Fire Code and Safety Code.

C. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION - Final Right-of-Way plat for
Shadow Creek Ranch West Clear Lake Loop, Portions of South Clear Lake Loop
and Kingsley Drive, and Trinity Bay Drive, 25.425 acres being out of the H.T. &
B.R.R. Co. Survey, Section 82, Abstract 565, The S.G. Haynie Survey, Abstract
212 and the H.T. & B.R.R. Co. Survey, Section 83, Abstract 305, City of
Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas

D. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION - Final Plat of Creekside
Section Two, 26.751 acres out of the D.H.M. Hunter Survey, Abstract 76, City of
Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas

E. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION —Preliminary Plat of O’Reilly
Pearland, being a subdivision of 0.8609 acre of land in Section 17 of the H.T. &
B.R.R. Co. Survey, Abstract No. 242, In the City of Pearland, Brazoria County,
Texas: Being Tract 17 of Westchester Estates, and unrecorded subdivision in the
City of Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas

F. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION - Final Plat of Reyes Estates,
a subdivision of 2.2510 acres of land out of a 60.13 acre tract in the Allison —
Richey Gulf Coast Home Company’s Suburban gardens, H.T. & B.R.R. Co.
Survey, Section 10, Abstract 505, City of Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas

G. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION - Remove from table -A
Replat of a portion of Commercial Reserve Block 12, West Lea, Section 3 Section
16 H.T. & B.R.R. Survey abstract 546, City of Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas
Volume 12, Page 23 & 24 Plat Records of Brazoria County

Page 1 of 2 - P&Z AGENDA



PLANNING AND ZONING COMMISSION

H. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION - A Replat of a portion of
Commercial Reserve Block 12, West Lea, Section 3 Section 16 H.T. & B.R.R.
Survey abstract 546, City of Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas Volume 12, Page
23 & 24 Plat Records of Brazoria County

I. DISCUSSION ITEM - Regarding a proposed 10.407 acre Planned Unit
Development (PUD), located at the north west corner of Halik Road and SH 35.

NEXT MEETING DATES: June 14, 2004 — JPH for Comprehensive Update
June 21, 2004 — JPH & Regular P & Z
July 19, 2004 — JPH & Regular P & Z

III. ADJOURNMENT

This site is accessible to disabled individuals. For special assistance, please call
Young Lorfing at 281-652-1655 prior to the meeting so that appropriate
arrangements can be made.

i/ ]
Posted this day of X LL/VLL 2004A.D.
Removed this. || ‘rkday of Jun 2004 A.D.

Page 2 of 2 - P&Z AGENDA



PLANNING AND ZONING COMMISSION

AGENDA OF A REGULAR MEETING FOR THE PLANNING AND ZONING
COMMISSION OF THE CITY OF PEARLAND, TEXAS, TO BE HELD ON
JUNE 7, 2004 AT 6:30 P.M., IN THE SECOND FLOOR CONFERENCE ROOM
OF CITY HALL, 3519 LIBERTY DRIVE, PEARLAND, TEXAS

L CALL TO ORDER

IL. NEW BUSINESS

A. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION — Remove from table the
Adoption of the 2000 International Building Code, Fire Code and Safety Code.

B. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION —Adoption of the 2000
International Building Code, Fire Code and Safety Code.

C. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION - Final Right-of-Way plat for
Shadow Creek Ranch West Clear Lake Loop, Portions of South Clear Lake Loop
and Kingsley Drive, and Trinity Bay Drive, 25.425 acres being out of the H.T. &
B.R.R. Co. Survey, Section 82, Abstract 565, The S.G. Haynie Survey, Abstract
212 and the H.T. & B.R.R. Co. Survey, Section 83, Abstract 305, City of
Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas

-

D. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION - Final Plat of Creekside
Section Two, 26.751 acres out of the D.H.M. Hunter Survey, Abstract 76, City of
Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas

E. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION —Preliminary Plat of O’Reilly
Pearland, being a subdivision of 0.8609 acre of land in Section 17 of the H.T. &
B.R.R. Co. Survey, Abstract No. 242, In the City of Pearland, Brazoria County,
Texas; Being Tract 17 of Westchester Estates, and unrecorded subdivision in the
City of Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas

F. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION - Final Plat of Reyes Estates,
a subdivision of 2.2510 acres of land out of a 60.13 acre tract in the Allison —
Richey Gulf Coast Home Company’s Suburban gardens, H.T. & B.R.R. Co.
Survey, Section 10, Abstract 505, City of Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas

G. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION - Remove from table -A
Replat of a portion of Commercial Reserve Block 12, West Lea, Section 3 Section
16 H.T. & B.R.R. Survey abstract 546, City of Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas
Volume 12, Page 23 & 24 Plat Records of Brazoria County

Page 1 of 2 - P&Z AGENDA

———



PLANNING AND ZONING COMMISSION

H. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION - A Replat of a portion of
Commercial Reserve Block 12, West Lea, Section 3 Section 16 H.T. & B.R.R.
Survey abstract 546, City of Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas Volume 12, Page
23 & 24 Plat Records of Brazoria County

I. DISCUSSION ITEM - Regarding a proposed 10.407 acre Planned Unit
Development (PUD), located at the north west corner of Halik Road and SH 35.

NEXT MEETING DATES: June 14, 2004 — JPH for Comprehensive Update
June 21, 2004 — JPH & Regular P & Z
July 19,2004 — JPH & Regular P & Z

III. ADJOURNMENT

R

‘“f .
This site is accessible to disabled individuals. For special assistance, please call
Young Lorfing at 281-652-1655 prior to the meeting so that appropriate

arrangements can be made.

Page 2 of 2 — P&Z AGENDA



PLANNING & ZONING COMMISSION MEETING OF JUNE 7, 2004
AGENDA ITEM

SUBJECT: Consideration of Final Plat for Shadow Creek Ranch Right-of-Way for
‘West Clear Lake Loop, Portions of South Clear Lake Loop, Kingsley Drive, and Trinity
Bay Drive

LOCATION: Central portion of Shadow Creek Ranch
APPLICANT: Steven D. Tinnin, LJA Engineering & Surveying, Inc.

ANALYSIS:

Zoning — Not Applicable - Right-of-Way

Traffic and Transportation — Traffic Impact Analysis (T.I.A.) provided as part of Shadow
Creek Master Plan,

Utility Considerations — Water and sewer will be extended by developer to serve
adjoining areas.

Stormwater Management — Stormwater detention will be provided as per Shadow Creek
Master Plan (Multi-Lake System).

Parks and Open Space — Not applicable

ATTACHMENTS:
Application Form
Final Plat

OUTSTANDING ITEMS:

1.) Survey line should be the same line weight throughout on Sheet 2

2.) Show the dividing line between Abstracts A-212and A-565 on Sheet 2

3.) Label dashed line west of the intersection of Kingsley Drive and Regents Bay Drive
on Sheet 2.

4.) Label both abstracts which appear on Sheet 3 and the line separating them.

5.) Label both abstracts which appear on the left edge of Sheet 4 and the line separating
them.

6.) It seems that the plat title would read easier if the first word “AND” was eliminated.




FINAL PLAT SUBMITTAL APPLICATION

DATE FILED:June 1, 2004 P&Z MEETING DATE:June 7, 2004

SUBDIVISION NAME/LOCATION:Shadow Creek Ranch West Clear Lake Loop, Portions of

South Clear Lake Loop and Kingsley Drive, and Trinity Bay Drive
Lot(s): O Block(s): 0 Reserve(s): 0.

PRIMARY CONTACT(Print or Type): Steven D. Tinnin Phone: (713) 953-5023
MAILING ADDRESS: LJA Engineering & Surveying, [nc., 2929 Briarpark, Suite 600
Houston, TX 77042

OWNER NAME(Print or Type): Pearland Investments, LP Phone: (702) 736-6151
MAILING ADDRESS: 5195 Las Vegas Boulevard South, Las Vegas, NV 89119

AGENT'S NAME(Print or Type): Jason R. Banda Phone: (713) 953-5067
MAILING ADDRESS: LJA Engineering & Surveying, Inc., 2929 Briarpark, Suite 600
Houston, TX 77042

The following required documents must accompany the final plat when submitted to staff:

22 Folded Prints of Final Plat X Completed Checklist
X 2 sets of Final Plat mylars X Current Title Report
(3 sets if ETJ) mzLAny Variance Request(s) in Letter Form
Show Approval of Construction Plans Xl Certified Tax Certificates (no taxes can be due)
X] Show Approval of Drainage Report Final Plat Staff Review Mark-Up
Show Approval of Traffic Impact Analysis Application fee {$400 plus $4 per lot
%Park Fees (if required) or $25 per acre)

NOTE: ALL REQUIRED DOCUMENTS MUST BE SUBMITTED TO ENGINEERING DEPT.
STAFF BY 9 A.M. THE MONDAY PRECEEDING THE PLANNING AND ZONING
COMMISSION MEETING. INCOMPLETE SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED.

The undersigned hereby request approval by the Planning and Zgnin ission of t

above identified subdivision plat.

Signature: Signature/
(Owner)

Fee: § hoyiﬂ I"B Date Paid: li ’2 5’0/% Receipt No.: \ \ qsq lé




PLANNING & ZONING COMMISSION MEETING OF JUNE 7, 2004
AGENDA ITEM

SUBJECT: Consideration of Final Plat of Creekside Section Two

LOCATION: West corner of Extension of Barry Rose Road and Pearland Parkway

APPLICANT: Steven D. Tinnin, LJA Engineering & Surveying, Inc.

ANALYSIS:

Zoning — R-3

Traffic and Transportation — Traffic Impact Analysis previously approved for entire
Creekside development.

Utility Considerations — Water and sewer available and will be extended by the developer
into the subdivision.

Stormwater Management — Strormwater detention provided onsite for both Sections of
Creekside.

Parks and Open Space — Onsite park with improvements being provided.

ATTACHMENTS:
Application Form
Final Plat

OQUTSTANDING ITEMS:
1.) SWB utility letter
2.) Approved tree disposition plan
3.) 1% construction fee due
4.) Show exist 10’ W.S.E. along Barry Rose Road from Creekside Section One plat.



FINAL PLAT SUBMITTAL APPLICATION

DATE FILED:5/28/04 P&Z MEETING DATE:6/7/04

SUBDIVISION NAME/LOCATION:Creekside, Sec. 2
Lot(s): 107 Block(s): 3 Reserve(s): 4

PRIMARY CONTACT(Print or Type): Steven D. Tinnin . Phone: (713) 953-5023
MAILING ADDRESS: LJA Engineering & Surveying, Inc., 2929 Briarpark, Suite 600
Houston, TX 77042

OWNER NAME(Print or Type): RH of Texas, L.P. Phone: (713) 856-2800
MAILING ADDRESS: 4700 W. Sam Houston Pkwy. N. # 150
Houston, TX 77041

AGENT'S NAME(Print or Type): Steven D. Tinnin Phone: (713) 953-5023
MAILING ADDRESS: LJA Engineering & Surveving, Inc., 2929 Briarpark, Suite 600
Houston, TX 77042

The following required documents must accompany the final plat when submitted to staff:

X 22 Folded Prints of Final Plat Completed Checklist ¢ Aok s4% f'f“"*’d”)
2 sets of Final Plat mylars X Current Title Report
(3 sets if ETJ) ] Any Variance Request(s) in Letter Form
X] Show Approval of Construction Plans ' Certified Tax Certificates (no taxes can be due)
D] Show Approval of Drainage Report X Final Plat Staff Review Mark-Up
[] Show Approval of Traffic impact Analysis Application fee ($400 plus $4 per lot
[] Park Fees (if required) or $25 per acre) $ g2H ®

NOTE: ALL REQUIRED DOCUMENTS MUST BE SUBMITTED TO ENGINEERING DEPT.
STAFF BY 9 A.M. THE MONDAY PRECEEDING THE PLANNING AND ZONING
COMMISSION MEETING. INCOMPLETE SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED.

The undersigned hereby request approval by the Planning and Zoning Commission of the
above identified subdivision plat.

Signature: Signat
(Owner)

‘_)_)2 L
Fee: $&Q g' Date Paid: ﬁfa%g "/




PLANNING & ZONING COMMISSION MEETING OF JUNE 7, 2004
AGENDA ITEM

SUBJECT: Consideration of Preliminary Plat for O’Reilly - Pearland

LOCATION: Souyhwest corner of Broadway and Westchester Circle

APPLICANT: Jared Riggenbach, Huitt-Zollars, Inc.

ANALYSIS:

Zoning — GB (General Business)

Traffic and Transportation — No. T.I.A. needed due to anticipated low volume of trips
generated; will probably only allow one driveway onto Westchester Circle. Joint
access driveway with property to the west (Goodyear Store) will be used.

Utility Considerations — Water and sewer available

Stormwater Management — On-site detention

Parks and Open Space — Not applicable

ATTACHMENTS:
Application Form
Preliminary Plat
OUTSTANDING ITEMS:

none



MAY-19-04 WED 08:35 AM  HUITT-ZOLLARS, INC. FAX NO. 2814860220 P02

[ SRC X} L DA

PRELIMINARY PLLAT SUBMITTAL APPLICATION
DATE FILED;__6/1 | o4 PAZMEETING DATE: ¢ /7 Jod.

SUBDIVISION NAME/LOCATION:__¢>' Ceney PeaktanD .
Lechrel BT _-THE SeotH wesT . cColyed of BRoanwet @0 wlasTelesmor CIRCLE

Lot(s); (o) . Block(s):__ _!/ ; Reserve(s): /

PRIMARY GONTACT (Print or Yype):_ Taren _Kitgendacy Phone: 281~ 496-00¢4

MAILING ADDRESS:_Huvtt - Zorsars, INc. 1500 S, Daey Aduseeo ST 20m
Rauston, Texns 776 77

OWNER NAME(Print or Type);_ £2WIN mM__ HARA CASTLE Phone:_Z81~484-154]

MAILING ADDRESS; 23Ul _&Reen Tes  Deiye

Pengeah , Texns _ TISR].

AGENT'S NAME(Print or Type); Hovve = Zau AeS , \AE, Phone: 281444 - o006,
MAILING ADDRESS:_1500 S, DaigY  WsHreen _STE. 200
Wovgron , Texas 11677

The following required documents must accompany the preliminary plat when submitled to staff;

M 22 folded prints of Preliminary Plat M Title Report or Certiticate of Title
M 3 copies of preliminary drainage report ' Staff Review Mark-Up
Wl Traffic Impact Analysis (it required) JX Tree Survey (same scale as plal)
X{ Application fee ($400 plus $6 per lot B Completed Checklist
or $30 per acre) Q Variance request(s) submitted in ictter form

NOTE: ALL REQUIRED DOCUMENTS MUST BE SUBMITTED TO ENGINEERING DEPT.
STAFF BY 9 A.M. THE MONDAY PRECEEDING THE PLANNING AND ZONING
COMMISSION MEETING. INCOMPLETE SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE ACCERTED,

The undersigned hereby request approval by the Planning and Zoning Commission of the
above identified subdivision plat.

Signature: Signature;

(Owner) gent)ﬁ '

Fee:$_420.00 Date Paid:__ Receipt No.:



PLANNING & ZONING COMMISSION MEETING OF JUNE 7, 2004
AGENDA ITEM

SUBJECT: Consideration of Final Plat for Reyes Estates

LOCATION: North side of Brookside Drive east of Stone Road

APPLICANT: Rafael Reyes

ANALYSIS:

Zoning — RE

Traffic and Transportation — Not applicable for single family lot.

Utility Considerations — Water and sewer not presently available. Water well and septic
system required. .
Stormwater Management — Onsite detention required.

Parks and Open Space — $350 park fee required

ATTACHMENTS:
Application Form
Final Plat

OUTSTANDING ITEMS:

1.) Show names of current P&Z Commissioners
2.} Note No. 11 not necessary

3.) Label dashed line at 185’ on plat

4.) Show 40’ front B.L.

5.) Add BCCF and BCDR to legend

6.) Explain dimension 611.53” in Brookside Road
7.) Remove Note No. 5

8.) Show location of streetlight

9,) Plat should be tied to a well-established point



S == —

PLANNING AND ZONING COMMISSION

AGENDA ITEM

CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE
ACTION :

Adoption of the 2000
International Building Code,
Fire Code and Safety Code.

Page 1 of 1 - P&Z AGENDA



AGENDA REQUEST
BUSINESS OF THE PLANNING & ZONING COMMISSION
CITY OF PEARLAND, TEXAS

AGENDA OF: 3-29-04 ITEM NO.
DATE SUBMITTED: 3-22-04 DEPARTMENT OF ORIGIN : Com. Development

PREPARED BY: Tobin E. Maples PRESENTOR: Steve Chapman & Kola Olayiwola

SUBJECT: Workshop Regarding the Adoption of the 2000 International Building Codes
and Life Safety Codes

EXHIBITS: See attachments

EXPENDITURE REQUIRED: None

AMOUNT BUDGETED: N/A
ACCOUNT NO. N/A

ADDITIONAL APPROPRIATION REQUIRED: N/A
ACCOUNT NO. N/A

FUNDS AVAILABLE (Finance Department Approval)

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

Currently, commercial (nonresidential) structures are permitted under the 1997 SBCCI (Southern
Building Code Congress International) and the 1997 Standard Fire Prevention Code. At tonight’s
workshop, staff will be presenting (PowerPoint presentation) the International Family of Codes,
which includes Building (IBC), Fire/Life Safety (IFC), Plumbing (IPC), Gas (IGC), and
Mechanical (IMC) codes. The International Family of Codes are the most widely utilized codes
within the municipal building industry and are stand-alone codes that address the design and
construction of structures that fall beyond the scope of the International Residential Code adopted
by the City last year. The International Fire Code serves as the prescriptive guide towards
assuring life safety within the built space.

As stated within the City Charter, the Planning and Zoning Commission is charged with
recommending to the City Council the amendment, extension and revision of the building code.
The intent of tonight’s workshop is to receive input from the City Council and Planning and
Zoning Commission with the goal of scheduling this item for consideration in April.




RECOMMENDED ACTION

Discuss International Family of Codes and direct staff accordingly.



T
EXISTING PROPOSED 2%

« City Ordinance -« Remove Existing.
Sec. 10-46: * Adopt New:

» 1997 Standard Fire. «_2000 International Fire
Prevention Code. Code. -

« 1997 NFPA 10! - Life + 2000 NFPA - 101 Life
Safety Code. -Safety Code. . -

* 1997 NFPA I -
National Fire Code
Handbook. -

Why Adopt the New Codes.?
- :-'sr{m'
+ Latest Minimum Standards for Fire and Lifé*=
Safety that apply to'new and existing structures.
_* Savelives & build safer buildings.
« Maintain pace with currerit' rends'and other
jurisdictions.
» Acquire credit for ISO - Texas Addendum -

» Codes change based on statistics collected on fires
resulting in deaths, injuries & property 10ss..

!




Why Amend the New Co

L
Clarification/Interpretation of what is written™™
Some sections are open ended and authority
driven,

Redefine existing outdated City Ordinances as
related to the Fire Code.

Codes are minimum standards. We should alpply

more than minimum standards in regards to lite

?_afety and the prevention of property loss due to
ire.

To partner better with our Fire Department in an

effort to maintain a safer Pearland.

i
Irp A

EXISTING PROPOSED
Ch. 10, Article VI - + Remove Existing.
“Fire Lanes” (1982). L. chlace with new
Fire lanes not Ordinance.
adequately addressed.  « Amend 2000

International Code to
reference new
ordinance.

Why?

Existing Ordinance ougdatedlunspeciﬁc’. N
reference to adopted Fire Code.

Only one option for marking of fire lanes. Not
always practical.

New ordinance is specific. Two options for
marking fire fanes, thereby benefiting the
business/property owner.




EXISTING

+ 2000 International Fire *
Code, Section 506,
Par. 506.] WHEN .
REQUIRED: “‘Where._
access to or within a
structure or area is
restricted because of -
secured openings or where
immediate access is
necessary for life-saving
or fire-fighting
purposes...”

Remove existing and
replace with:- -
“All new construction,
2-50% or more
renovation of an
existing structure, or
any building with a
monitored fire
alarm/sprinkler system
shall be required to
have a key box.”

¥ Existing is not s‘reciﬁc enough regarding 'ﬂ;}hlé
1d bave a Key Box, __

buildings shou

¥
T

h’a

» Key Accountability SOP in place.

» Installation options. (Building esthetics).
» Reduces potential for property dimage.
% Enables quicker Fire Department access.

Amendment 3

EXISTING

v State !r'censintg previously
required facilities over 3
clients in Foster Care,
Residential Day Cares, or
Personal Care Homes have a __
fire inspection.

v Still required to register with
the state.

¥ State no longer inspects
Facilities less than 12 clients.

- Group -Horijges.

LTI
PROPOSEQW'
¥ Require Residential Day
Cures, Persona! Care
Homes, and Foster Care
Homes over 3 clients to be
zrmitted by the city of
earland. ’
¥ Fire Inspection w/ Fee,
v NFPA 101-Life Safety Code
Compliance.




= Fire Marshal’s Office already inspéctmg
them.

= Location of facilities should be regulated.

= Save lives, prevent fires, keep unregulated
facilities out of the city.

Amendment 4 - Residential Fire

EXISTING PROPOSED "%

« New installations in +  Any new automatic fire
existing homes do not- atarm mstallation to
have to comply with 2000 .

e o comply with the 2000
Residential Standard... o
[Smoke Detectors not Residential Standard.
required in bedrooms or « Smoke detectors inside all

interconnected] bedrooms. in the hall, one
* Alarm companies on each floor.

installing these detectors  « Hardwired, Battery

to reduce costs... not Backup, [nterconnected.

properly educating the

consumer.

« Existing code only requirés a smoke detector
in the hallway on new burglat/fire alarm
installations in existing residential homes.

« The 2000 Standard for new residential
installations requires smoke detectors be
located inside and outside bedrooms and
interconnected together to insure better
detection & occupant notification.




Amendment 5 — Multi-family

EXISTING
< Multi-family dwellings:
more than 2 stories, or

Dwellmgs

PROPGS 5%

-.'All multi- famlly
dwellings are requlred o

more than 16 units be fully sprinklered
required to be - - regardless of height or.
sprinklered. number of units.

< Hotels: Sprinklers - - --- Including balconies,
required. Exception: Not ~ patios and porches.
more than 3 stories with  <* All hotels are required to
an exit leading to an exit be sprinklered regardless
access. of height or arrangement

of exits

+«» Apartment fires common.

<+ Usually very large and hard to fight.

"Large numbers of families usually affected.
% You can’t ‘fire prevent’ yourself from the guy
next door!

%+ Bar-B-Que pits being used on patios. Not allowed,
but common place. -

< If patio is sprinklered it's allowed per code,

< NFPA-13R doesn’t require sprinklers on patios..

«» We are requiring it with this amendment.

Amendment 6 - Storage.

EXISTING
+* Mini-storage fac:htles
over 12,000 sq.ft. o
more than 3 stories m
height required to be
fire sprinklered.

PROPOSED%T
«Sprinklers required in
all storage facilities
over 5,000 sq. ft.,
-regardless of height.

+ Fire separations every

+»Being constructed
lacger than 12,000sq. -5,000 sq. flLnoran
ft. exceplion to

% Fire walls being SmeklEl‘S
erected every 12,000 -~ --

sq.ft. to avoid
sprinklers. -




% Numerous Mini-storage facilities being
constructed throughout the city.

«sEverything one can imagine being stored.

« Storage is unregulated.

< Potential for extremely dangerous fire.

«»Delay in receiving fire call due to unoccupied
structure.

<+ Greatly assists Fire Department in quickly
containing and extinguishing the fire.

Amendment 7 - Assemblies

EXISTING PROPOSED ;7250
= 300 eccupants: Fire « Amend 2000 International
Alarm systeni required. - Fire Code to match Life
+ >1000 occupants: : Safety Code for all new
Emergency Yoice Alarm assemblies, thus requiring
Evacuation (EVAC) an (EVAC) fire alarm

system required.

+ NFPA 101 - Life Safety
Code: facilities >300
occupants, zot 1000, must
install EVAC syslem.

system,

» Assembly occupancies accommodate large
numbers of people under one roof.

» Likelihood-of panic exists.

% Provides a less stressful alarm.
»Promotes safe and orderly evacuation.
% Pre-recorded or live instructions.




. Amendment 8 — Commercial Fire
Alarms
R

EXISTING 03
— = Typically not required _ «_Monitoring required.
to be monitored or have = At least one type of
smoke detection based automatic detection
on occupancy. T 7 required: (smoke, ligat;
* Only manual operation sprinklers). '
usually réquired. ™" 75" Manwal operation only
= When sprinklers not acceptable,
" required, then - - -- - .-
monitoring is required.

eeg

B

Commercial Fire Ala 914

EXISTING
--| --*_When Sprinklered:

« Manual operation may
manual operation not be omitted when®
allowed to be omitted sprinklérs installed.
adjacent to exit doors. "« Firé alirim panels and

_= Fire alarm panels may communicators shall be
be addressable andfmay~  addressable and provide
be in a ‘constantly occupant notification

| - attended location’ for - —throughout the building.

panel supervision.

v Earlier detection of fires g

v Insure complete occupant notification. .. _

v No such thing as a ‘constantly attended location’.

" Fire Alarms.can prevent excessive property loss,
in addition to saving:lives. T

¥ Early detection pfus monitoring gets the Fire
Department there quicker,-saves-lives, and - ..
prevents property loss .

-| -- Addressable systems help the Fire Department

locate the fire quicker and increases Firefighter

safety & survival.




Amendment 9 - Fire Department

Connection (FDC)
L R R
EXISTING PROPOSERSTA®EDE
o 1997 Standard Fire o Adopt and amiend 200057
Prevention Code: requires International Fire Code:
FDC street side and within o FDC shall be street side,
100" of a Fire Hydrant. remotely located along a
o 2000 International Fire fire apparatus access road,
Cods: requires fully visible, and us much as is
Jocated at nearest point of practical, at a distance
fire apparatus access, greater than the height of
located so as not to obstruct the building.
other fire apparatus from o FDC shall have a 5" Storz
approaching. Connection with locking
o Location of FDXC and cap and be within 100°
hydrant shall be approved feet of a fire hydrant.
by code official.
. XL
QOWhenan FDC is used:

There is a water supply problem and/or the firé is
overwhelming the fire sprinkler system.

Q1 At this point, the apparatus should not be close 10
the building and should bé located 0 as to protect
the firefighters and apparatus in the event ofa
building collapse.

DO A fire hydrant should be in close proximity to the
FDC to supply the apparatus with water via large
diameter hose (LDH). .

Amendment - 10 Exits
e

EXISTING PROPOSEF Y

» <75 feet travel distance ~ ® Assembly, Business,

and occupant load of 50 Mercantile, Educational

or less, on ground level: and cther_Hazardm:s

it ired. occupancies, lravel
Only one exit. Tequs distance >50 feet to an
. . exit
e ol Aremotely separa ol
h required,
occupant load is over 50. pl?m e, with exit door

swing in the direction of
egress, regardless of
occupant load.




> Insure safer evacuation of all occupants i
an emergency in new commercial
structures.

¥ Scécond ingress/egress for Firefighterss -
enhancing their safety.

»New commercial structures over 50 feet
deep will have a second egress, thereby
providing a safer business.— - -

Amend;né;l; -1 J_FT;':;;e—s

et

- - - “dw

EXISTING PROPOSED;

-6.Tire storage shall be. o Amend 2000
restricted to piles not International Fire

_ _exceeding 5,000 sq.ft, Code to address

o Piles shall not exceed incoming and

_ 50,600 cubic ft. in outgoing tires on
volume or 10 feetin =~ trucksortrailers. -
height. o Tires placed on the
T - - ground for 24 hours -

shall be placed in non-

.. combustible racks.

e
o Regardless of being whole, split, sh;gddedéj
orchopped:

- 0 Tires not intended for retail or wholesale
consumption shall not be allowed to
accumulate.  Tires shall be removed from
premise regularly and not allowed fo over-

- - accumulate, creating a public nuisance,
health, or fire hazard.




o Over accumulation of tires a serious
problem with serious consequences,

o Fire, Health, Environmental & Appearance.
o Do not want a large tire fire in the city.

o Very costly.

o Very dangerous.

Amendment 12 - Permits

PROPOSAL PROPOSAE conty=r

+ Ch.45,2000 International  + List the specific amounts
Fire Code: PERMITS permisslible. per hhg pcmnnills

+ Amend City Ordinance: currently required by the city,
Remove Secions 1093 100 pe i e eview
lhrgugh 10-101 i their inspection, testing, and
entrety. permitting):

+ Reference 2000 « Fees to be a percemtage of the
International Fire Code, value as required through
most current NFPA current building permit process.
Standards and DOT « Required Eennilting of
Regulations for handling, Installed Fire Protection

storing, and transporting of Systems.
Hazardous Materials.

- Permits

TN,

« Adopt certain fees as related to types
permits.

« Temporary storage tanks (Hazardous
Liquids/Gases).

« State licensed facilities that we inspect for
fire code compliance {daycares, group
homes).

10



« Become more familiar with specific hazards ™
located within the city.

« Insure adequate maintenance of and properly
regulate what is being installed and to what
standard it is installed.

= Insure a greater margin of safety for the general
pubiic and for our First Responders.

 Become better prepared for a Haz-Mat emergency
and ultimately avert a disaster. - -

Amendment 13- Bar—B Que. E:gs_

Al T
i
EXISTING PROPOSED
« Open-flame cooking < Add: -~ -~
devices, Bar-B-Que Charcoal burners, solid
Pits shall not be - fuel cookers, & Bar-B-
operated on Que pits shall not be
combustible balconies used inside a structure
or within 10 feet of a unless specifically
structure. intended and listed for
inside use.
v 2
) »i@'lrlym*
SLawTs

. To avoid non-listed cookers bemg used 2
inside structures. -

*» Very dangerous inside structures.

» Can easily cause a fire‘and create an”
extreme health hazard.

« Only listed cookers should be used inside
structures, regardless of whether they are
located under a vent hood system.

11



Amendment 14 - Standpipes

= Class I Standpipes: = Amend to read:

Firefighter use only. When a standpipe is

= Class IT Standpipes: required, Class T & 1T
Occupant use only. will be the only type

« Class IIf Standpipes: acceptable.
Combination + Remove all Sections
Firefighter and referencing Class 11
Cccupant use. Standpipes.

T AR

* Occupants should not be trying to fight the fire,
they should be evacuating. )

= Potential delay in evacuation and calling 911.

« Hoses and nozzles installed generally go un-
maintained and deteriorate quickly.

= Water pressure is often limited and occupants are
not adequately trained on the proper use of the
equipment.

Amendment 15 — Excessive False

Fire Alarms
" ¥ ‘h}:.i
EXISTING PROPOSETF S-S}
Currently no ordinance « Add Anticle VIL - Excessive
addressing excessive False False Fire Alamms. [mirror
Fire Alarms. current Excessive False
No provision to require Security Alam Ordinance].
annual Fire Alarm Permit. + Amend with:
Do have ordinance « More than 5 False Fire
addressing Excessive False Alurms per calendar year
Alarms for Security Alarms. will result in a fine.

Provides fine for more than ~ * Al fire alarms will require
5 Fatse Alarms per calendar annual pem\iu;l;g,ifOnly one

year. fee 10 be usses
Requires annual permit for premises protected by both
the Security Alarm. Fire & Security Alarm.

12



* Become more farmllar with location of alam]ed

facilities. - - - .
« Reduce number of. costlylunneceqsary responses to

false fire alarms. . . o
* Recoversome of those costs.

_ .+ Maintain up to date emergency information

_ + Insure Fire Alarm SyQtems are bemg adcquately

database on protected buildings.

maintained. ~

-~ - - Amendment-16 .
Fixed Fire Suppression System

EXISTING PROPOSED
s 2000 International Fire = _Add additional paragraph:
Code, Sec. 904.3.5- « If the building has'no fire
Monitoring: alarm., the fixed fire-

-extinguishing system shall
have a local electronic bell
or horn to provide

+ Where a'building fire
alarm system is installed,
automatic fire-

extmgmshmg systems occupant notification upon
shall be connected to the activation of the system.
albarm. .., . __ L

» Insure occupant notification of Automanc i
" Fire Extinguishing Systef activation.

* Initiate a more timely evacuation of

occupants in a kitchen fire emergency.

13



Adopt 2000 International

EXISTING
« 1997 Standard
Mechanical Code.
+ Code of Ordinances,
Ch. 7, Article I11, Sec.
7-51.

Mechanical Coc
‘ o i
PROPOSED ™™
« Adopt 2000
International
Mechanical Code.

« Code of Ordinances,
Ch. 7, Article 111, Sec,
7-51.

* Maintain pace with current standards.

+ Correlate with the adoption of 2000
International Codes

« Avoid potential conflicts between codes.

EXISTING
» Sec. 606.1-Smoke
Detection Systems
Control:

» When air handling

PROPOSED %
% require smoke/duct
detector on supply

side, to match NFPA

Mechanical Code.

systems are over 2,000 > Detector required in

cfm, a smoke/duct

detector is required on

the refurn air side.

both codes, on both
supply and reterm,
when over 15,000
cfm.

14



EXISTING:

+ Detector allowed to
annunciate as supervisory
signal when connected to a
fire alarm. (no occupant
notification or automatic Fire
Department response).

* Air handler required to, shut
down.

+ Detectors often.diff} cul! 0
locate as a result of bemg

-installed in less than obvious
locations. -

Detectors require nnunciate
as alarm signal, activating the
fire atarm, initiating building
evacuation and F. D, response. *
Remote indicator required
below ce:lmg to readily identify
location-of detector.
Connection to fire alarm system
required if one is instatled.

If no fire alurm, remote audible |
‘and. v1sual indicator required.

V]

* Earlier detectwn. initiating quicker shut down

« Fire will usually auto-éxtinguish. -

s Alarri activation will initiate evaciation. o
* Will initiate F.D. response.
* Protect.the structure at night while unoccupled

. 1!"

-

15



FIRE CODE

Adoption:

Amend Sec. 10-46, Article Ill, Fire Code of City. [Remove 1997 Standard Fire
Prevention Code and replace with]:

Section 10-46 International Fire Code (IFC) Adopted.

The International Fire Code, 2000 Edition, including appendices as published by the
International Code Council, Inc. is hereby adopted by reference and made part of this
Ordinance, With the exception of Sec. 307 Open Burning. This wording shall be
added at the end of each section of 307.1 to read: "No person shall kindle or maintain
any type of open fire/burning, bonfires or recreational fires and including trench-burn
fires as defined by TCEQ (Texas Commission on Environmental Quality) within the city
and within the area immediately adjacent and contiguous to the city limits extending for
a distance outside the city limits for a total of five thousand (5,000) feet. Only in the
City of Pearland’s city limits and the (ETJ) Exira Territorial Jurisdiction shall this be
enforced. Such open fire(s) in these specified areas are hereby declared to be a
common and public nuisance.” Exceptions to the rule would apply to live firefighting
training conducted by the Fire Department so long as compliant with TCEQ
regulations, barbecue pits used for cooking, or an approved outdoor fireplace used for
warmth that has three sides and a spark arrestor and complies with Sec. 307. The fire
official may prohibit any or all fires, or order the immediate extinguishment of any and
all fires when atmospheric conditions or local circumstances make such fires
hazardous or the smoke or ash from such fire(s) becomes a common and public
nuisance.

Remove 1997 Life Safety Code and adopt 2000 Life Safety Code. This standard shall
apply for repairs, alterations, renovations and maintenance of all commercial buildings
and appurtenances. When a conflict occurs with the International Codes or referenced
NFPA standards, the provisions of the most restrictive shall apply. Amendments to the
referenced standards become part of this code.



Amendment#1 -~ - ¢ U7 e

Fire Apparatus Access Roads’ S Co

Sec. 503 - Markings, amend to add to the end of paragraph Sec. 503.3

FIRE LANES, Remove in-its entirety Article' Vi of City Code of Ordinances and

replace with the following Fire Lane ordinance: - :. ’
' " ' ." - - f . . 'l }" i

Whenever any provision regarding the regulatioti: of fire lanes contained in the

most recent ‘edition” of the International-Fire ‘Code adopted by the City are in

conflict with the provisions of this-subsection, the provisions of this subsection

shall govern.

(1) The owner, manager, or person in charge of-any new or existiﬁg building or

property for which fire 'lanes have been approved or required by the Fire Marshal

or his authorized representativé shall'mark and.'maintain said fire lanes as

. provided below,

"“"(a)'All curbs and' curb-ends shall be painted red with:four inch (4") white
lettering stating "NO PARKING - FIRE LANE". Wording may not be
spaced more than twenty-five feet (25°) apart. Lettering shall be at least
one half-inch ( %2") stroke. Fire lanes shall be marked-on both sides with
a minimum of twenty-four (24’) clear width in the middie regardless of
road width. SO

(b) Fire lanes should not initmediately'adjoin the structure if possible, but be
close enough to-allow sufficient-access. They should be placed so as to
cover at least three sides of the structure. The.required turn radius on
inside turns shall be tenty-five (25°) and -on.outside turns fifty-feet
(50°). R SRR

(c) In areas where fire lanes are‘required, but no -continuous curb is
available, one of the following methods shall be used, in conjunction
with the curb markings, to indicate that the fire lane is continuous:

(i) Option #1: Signs twelve inches (12") wide and eighteen
inches (18") in height with red lettering on a white’
background stating “NO PARKING - FIRE LANE” shall
be mounted conspicuously along the edge of the fire

- lane. Signs may be'spaced-no. more than twenty-five
feet (25') apart and the lettering shall be at least three-
eighths inch (3/8") stroke (see Appendix D 103.6 Signs
of 2000 International Fire Code) - - -



(i) Option #2: From the point the fire lane begins to the
point the fire lane ends, including behind all parking
spaces which adjoin a fire lane, shall be marked with
one continuous red stripe having a minimum width of
at least four inches (4") painted on the drive surface
behind the parking 'spaces. Red stripes and curbs
adjoining a fire lane must be painted in red. Red
stripes and curbs will contain the wording “NO
PARKING - FIRE LANE” painted in four inch (4”) white
letters. Wording may not be spaced more than twenty-
five feet (25°) apart. ]

Remove from Fire Code: Appendix D103.6.2

Roads more than 26 feet in width. o

Fire apparatus access roads more than 26 feet wide (7925 mm) to 32 feet wide (9754
mm) shall be posted on one side of the road as a fire lane. -

Sec. D103.6.1 Amend 1o read: Fire access roads that are required to be marked
shall be a minimum width of twenty-four feet (24’) wide and shall be marked on
both sides.

Amendment # 2

~ §F506.1Key Boxes

When required.
Where access to or within -a structure or an area is restricted because of secured
openings ' or ‘where immediate access is necessary for life-saving or fire-fighting
purposes, the code official is authorized to require a key box to be installed in an
accessible location. The key box shall be of an approved type and shall contain keys
to gain access fo the structure or area as required by the code official.

Sec. 506.1 Key Boxes. All new construction or substantial improvement (50% or
more) to existing buildings with pre-existing monitored fire protection systems
(alarm/sprinkler) shall be required to have a key box approved by the Fire
Marshal.

Amendment # 3

§F903.2.5 Group |. -
An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings with a Group |

fire area.

EXCEPTION: An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with §F903.3.1.2
or §F903.3.1.3 shall be allowed in Group I-1 faciiities.

1



It is hereby proposed that the Authority Having Jurisdiction {AHJ), (i.e., the Pearland
Fire Marshal or his designee) shall inspect and approve all registered and licensed
. personal care facilities, all foster care, child-care,’ and group-homes within the City of
Pearland for compliance with the current adopted fire code. Furthermore, any facility or
home that houses individuals that are incapable’ of self-preservation as defined by the
Life Safety Code, N.F.P.A. 101 shall be protected throughout by an approved N.F.P.A.
72 fire alarm, and N.F.P.A. 13 automatic sprinkler system.

Exception 1: In the case of personal care facilities, child-care, group homes, and foster
care with children under the age of 18, or in-home residential child care under the age
of 18, and clients that nurmber less than 6, or group hofme settings with children under
the age of 18, and clients that number less than 6, and a person is incapable of self-
preservation a 13 R, or 13 D automatic sprinkler system, is approved for this
application. Plans for installation shall be forwarded to the AHJ for review and
permitting. ‘ ' IR :

Exception 2: In the case of personal care facilities, child-care, group homes, with
children under the age of 18, or in-home residential child care under the age of 18, and
clients that nuimber less than 6, or group home settings with ¢hildren under the age of
18, and clients that number less than 6, a residential automatic fire alarm system with
smoke detection through out is'approved for this application. Plans for installation shall
be forwarded to the AHJ for review and permitting.

_ Initiation of the automatic residential fife alarm shall be by smoke detection and
activation of the automatic sprinkler system interconnected with the alarm system, and
shall have emergency force notification. o <y

3 r -

Special definition:

! N N -
LI i

Self- preservation- the ability of a client, or occupant, due to physical or mental
impairment to evacuate an occupancy without direct intervention by any other person,
or the need of any equipment. This definition does not include equipment such as
ladders or chutes used for evacuation from a second story. :

Inspection of all facilities shall be required upon passage of this ordinance. Installation
of the automatic sprinkier’ system' and/or automatic fire alarm system with_smoke
detection shall be " upon the permitting” ‘of all new construction, or the
registering/licensing of a facility that houses persons incapable of self- preservation, or
as required by the AHJ.~ L L

This amendment to the city code of ordinances is needed for facilities that are not
covered by inspection. This leaves an unknown numbeér ‘of homes and facilities that
house clients without the ability of self-preservation un-inspected or protected. These
homes and facilities should be held to the 'same standards as any other facility. The
state registers these facilities but does- not require compliance with minimum fire
safety standards. :



Amendment # 4

All new installations of a residential automatic fire alarm system shall comply
with the current addition of NFPA 72. This requires smoke detectors in all
sleeping rooms, in the hallway outside the sleeping rooms and one per floor.
The detectors shall be interconnected and electrically hard wired with battery
backup.

Amendment # 5
Building Code Sec. 903.2.7 & 903.2.8 reference same as Fire Code

§F903.2.8 Group R-2

An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group R-2 buildings
with a fire area where more than two stories in height, including basements, or having
more than 16 dwelling units.

Amend Sec. 903.2.8 Group R

All “R-1 and R-2” occupancies (apartments, multi-family dwellings, hotels,
motels) regardless of number of units or story height shall be sprinklered
throughout including balconies, patios and porches.

Sec. 903.2.7 an automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
buildings with a Group R-1 (hotels and motels) fire area.

Remove exception Sec. 903.2.7 R-1

1. Where guestrooms are not more than three stories above the lowest level of
exit discharge and each guestroom has at least one door leading to an exterior
exit access that leads directly to approved exits.

Amendment # 6
Building Code Sec. 903.2.10 (same as Fire Code)

§F903.2.10 Group S-1

An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all buildings where the fire
area containing a Group S-1 occupancy exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 m"2), or
where more than three stories in height, or where the combined fire area on all floors,
including mezzanines, exceeds 24,000 square feet (2230 m"2).

Sec. 903.2.10 Group S.

All storage facilities (S-1/5-2) moderate/low-hazard that are 5000 sq. ft. or more
shall be fully sprinkled, regardless of the fire area and aggregate floor area.
Installation of fire separations is not an exception to sprinklers on structures
that have a fire area greater than 5000 sq. ft.



Amendment #7

Building Code Sec: 907:2.1.1 (same as Fire Code)
L e T

Sec. 907211 ‘ ) B N NI I v o .
Systemvinitiation in Group A'(Assemiblies) with an occupant load of 1,000 or more shall
activate an Emergency Voiée Alarm Communication (EVAC) System. .. . -
Amend to read: - N

. All new and existing Assembly Buildings'with an'occupa‘hi,loaci of 300 or-greater
"shall install Emergency Voice Evacuation. (EVAC) systems in.accordance. with

et e

NFPA72. -~ °* B

" Building Code Sec. 907.14 (sarie as Fire Code) i L
§F907.15 IO
Monitoring.

Where required by this chapter, an approved supervising station in accordance with
NFPA 72 shall monitor fire alarm systems. :
T e

Sec. 907.15 - Add to the end of the paragraph: ‘ _
All alarm activations monitored by an .approved supervising station shall not
undergo pre-qualification. The area fire department will inmediately be notified
of all alarm activations. -~ + ST e e
Add a new section:
Sec. 907.7.1 Evacuation- Upon activation of any automatic fire alarm system all
occupants of the structure shall be evacuated and remain outside the structure
_ until the fire department has determined that no-fire or danger exists: Occupants

of the structure shall not réset an alarm.activation so as to enable fire
department personnel to locate:the -area .or zone: activated.. Any trained
individual with’ the‘responsibility to respond to an:emergency may silence alarm
activations '~ - S Co L

. Ame_n‘dment #8 Comm'ercih!-Fifg Alarms

-

'Bﬁi_ld;ing G_odé 'Séc.'90'7:2 (reference same as Fire Code) T

Sec. 907.1.2 Add: All new fire alarm systems shall be addressable and
communication devices shall be compatible for emergency force notification.
The system shall have occupant notification throughout: the, building in
compliance with ADA requirements, and manual pull stations shall be required
by all exits regardless of any exceptions in the code to remove them: ..



§F907.2 Where required.

New buildings and structures.

An approved manual, automatic, or manual and automatic fire alarm system shall be
provided in new buildings and structures in accordance with §F907.2.1 through
§F907.2.23. Where automatic sprinkler protection installed in accordance with
§F903.3.1.1 or §F903.3.1.2 is provided and connected to the building fire alarm
system, automatic heat detection required by this section shall not be required.

Add to the end of Sec. 907.2:

“When the installation of a new fire alarm system is required in any type of
occupancy, at ieast one of the following means of automatic detection (smoke
detection, heat detection, or fire sprinklers) is required in addition to manual
operation of the fire system. All new installations shall be monitored for
emergency force notification and for integrity by means of a dedicated first
phone line. (this is to assure the Fire Dept. receives the call for emergency
response)

Amendment # 9

§F912.2 Fire Department Connection (FDC)

Location. ‘

With respect to hydrants, driveways, buildings and landscaping, fire department
connections shall be so located that fire apparatus and hose connected to supply the
system will not obstruct access to the buildings by other fire apparatus. The location
of fire department connections shall be approved by the AHJ.

Amend Sec. 912.2 and 903.3.7 to read: _

Location of Fire Department Connection (FDC).

The EDC shall be located at a point no further than 20 feet from a fire apparatus
access road, and remotely located at a horizontal distance that is greater than
the height of the building on the main street side, and easily accessible to the
Fire Department. The location of the FDC shall be so located as to provide hose
connections that shall not block access to the building or obstruct other fire
apparatus from accessing the building. There shall be an approved sign as
specified by the Fire Marshal designating the address served by the FDC. A fire
hydrant shall be located within 100’ of the Fire Department Connection
measured along a fire apparatus access road. FDC’s shall have a 5” Storz
connection and shall include an approved locking cap as specified by the Fire
Marshal. . : '

Amendment # 10

Buiiding Code Sec. 1004.2 (same as Fire Code)



§F1004.2 Exit access design requirements.~ «- R
The exit access portion of the means of egress system shall comply" with- the
applicable design‘reql_Jirements of §F1004.2.1 through §F1004.2.5.

Amend this section as follows: - -~ ! -~ )

Sec. 1004.2.1 Exit Access Doorways Required. Lo :

All assembly, business, mercantile, educational and hazardous occupancies
with more than 50 foot of travel distance to an exit doorway from any portion of
the building shall be provided with two means of egress that are remotely
separated (not on the same plane). All egress doors must swing in the direction
of the exit travel.

Amendment # 11

Sec. 2505.1 Individual Tire Piles and Storage.

All incoming tires by truck or trailer shall be off loaded within 24 hours and
worked into stock on non-combustible racks as required for all tire storage.
Tires are not to be left on the ground at the end of the workday and the truck or
trailer transporting the incoming tires shall be removed from the site
immediately following off-loading. - - Co

Outgoing tires intended for disposal, shall not be placed on the ground, but
instead stored in no more than one (1) enclosed trailer, (8’ x 8' x 20°; 1280 Cu. ft.)
on site. This includes any form of tires regardless: of whole, split shredded, or
chopped.

Tires not designated for retail or wholesale consumption shall not be allowed to
over-accumulate regardless of whole, split, shredded or chopped so as to
constitute a fire or health hazard within the city or within 5000 feet of the city
limits in Pearland's ETJ (Extra Territorial Jurisdiction). -.Such accumulations
shall be deemed a public and common nuisance.

Amendment # 12

§F105.1.1 Permits required. : T Cont o T .
Permits required by this code shall be obtained from the code official. Permit fees, if
any, shall be paid prior to issuance of the permit. Issued permits shall be kept on the
premises designated therein at all times and shall be readily available for inspection by
the code official.

Section 105.1.1 Amend to read as follows, replacing second sentence: Certain permits
and fees shall be required and are listed as attached. Permit fees shall be paid prior
to the issuance of the permit.



Amend and add Sec. 105.1.1.1 to Code of Ordinances, Ch. 10, Fire Prevention
FEE SCHEDULE:

Type | Permit (include review, inspection, testing, and permit) Fees shall be a
Percentage of the Value as by current Building Permits

Fire Sprinkler system install (First 10,000 square feet.

Each additional 10,000 square feet

Over 20 heads

Underground fire mains

Smoke control systems

Fire pumps

Standpipe system installation

Fixed Fire Protective Systems

Fire Alarm Installation

Flammable/combustible liquid storage tank installation or removal
Single/multi family residential automatic fire sprinkler éystem

Type Il Permits (includes permit and site inspection)

Temporary storage tanks $50.00

Fireworks- Amend Article IV Sec. 10-77 City Ordinance $50.00
Additional fees will apply for fire protection -

Each required re-inspection for non-compliance $25.00



Amend City Ordinance Sec. 10-92 Through 10-1 01 in their ent:rety

When permit-required. T oawvas s e g e -
Refer to adopted Fire Code for Hazardous Matenals and permtttmg of quanttt:es
Also refer to NFPA standards and DOT Regulations R

Hazardous matenals or explosive >25 pounds:or 25 gallons, $50;00;_ .
or as stated in’ sect|0n1 05 6 of thls code (mspected annually) Syt

= ,1 LT

Bulk storage or handllng facmtles of hazardous materlals $150 00
(inspected annually).

Flammable/combustible liquids (in other than dwellings)., .. -$50.00
>6 gallons of class | flammable liquid or >25
; _gallons of any ﬂammable/combustlble |quld S

" Compressed gases (other than dwelllngs) that store; i $5000
>2,000 cu. feet of flammable or >6,000 cufeetof: * ~.. o .2 -3 cu
non-flammable gas. Renewed annually.

Inspections

Foster Care (inspected every 2 years) o $25.00‘ t

e . r . -
L N N e r

Child or Aduit care facility (inspected annually) $50.00
Persona! Care Facility (inspectéd-annually) * ~.. - 1. - . 1-6clients
_ < $25.00. -

"7-16 clients.
$50 00

. '>16 cltents
i _.’$1_OQ.QO
Health Care Facilities ™ © '~ » ' . L e n 1-100 beds

$100.00

101-150 beds
$150.00

Over 150 beds
$200.00

10



Spray Painting, Dipping, Coating Facilities (annually) $50.00
Amendment # 13

§F307.5 Open-flame cooking devices - : , :
Charcoa! burners and other dpen-flame cooking devices shall not be operated on
combustible balconies or within 10 feet (3048 mm) of combustible construction.

EXCEPTIONS:
1. One-and two-family dwellings.

Sec. 307.5 - Add to the end of the paragraph before the exceptions:

Charcoal burners, solid fuel cookers, Bar-B-Que pits shall be listed for their
intended use and shall not be used inside a structure unless specifically
intended or listed for inside use.

Amendment # 14
Sec.905 Standpipe Systems

Remove Sec. 905.5, 905.5.2, 905.5.3 in their entirety as referring to Class Il
Standpipes ’

And amend to read: When a standpipe system is required only a Class | or Class
Il standpipe is acceptable with a 2 1/2" to 1 1/2" reducer attached. Class Il is
occupant use only and Class lll is occupant and Firefighter use. Class | is
Firefighter use only. '

Amendment # 15

Amend the Code of Ordinances, Chapter 10, Article VI, Sections 117 — 124 to
read as below.

(To provide an ordinance addressing False Fire Alarms, similar to the Excessive
Alarm ordinance utilized by the Police Department. Also requires permitting of
Fire Alarm Systems, providing a database of their locations, insuring proper
installation and maintenance, and thereby reducing the number of False Alarm
activations.)

11



Article VI
Definitions:

Alarm, Fire System: Any device or combination of devices intended to detect the
products' of combustion, fire, flame, in any occupancy. L

Alarm, dial: Any alarm or device that automatically selects a telephorie line and reports
a condition for a protected premises. T . : :

Alarm, false: The activation of an alarm system or device through mechanical failure,
malfunction, improper installation, or the negligence of the owner or lessee of a fire
alarm system or device or his employees,-agents or representatives. Specifically
excepted are acts of God, such-as false alarms caused by hurricanes, tornadoes,
eart‘hquakes and the like. . .

Alarm, home: Any alarm device or system that is connected to-a residence

Alarm site: The specific property or.area-of the premises ﬁpon or within which a fire
alarm system is or isto be installed. . :

Alarm system business: Any person employed by a fire alarm business whose duties
include altering, installing, maintaining, moving, repairing, .replacing, selling, servicing,
responding to or monitoring an alarm system. It shall also mean any person employed
" or otherwise associated- with an alarm business that has. access to confidential
information relating to a customer or subscriber of such alarm business which could be
used to compromise or defeat an alarm'system. -

‘Alarm user: Any person on whose premises a fire alarm system is maintained except
for alarm systems on motor vehicles and alarm:systems maintained by state, county or
municipal governments.

Central station: Any premise, equipped-to receive and display signals from any type of
alarms, and relays this information by live voice to the fire department dispatcher.

Fire Marshal:- The Fire Marshal, Pearland Fire Marshal;s Office, or his designated
representative. ' ?

City: The City of Pearland, Texas.
Person: Any individual, corporation, businéss, school district.or, other organization.

Subscriber: A person or business that buys or otherwise obtains an alarm system and
has a contract with an alarm business to.monitor and/or service the alarm system.

12



Sec. 10-117. Registration permits

No person shall operate, cause to be operated or permit the operation of an alarm
system unless a current registration permit has been issued by the Fire Marshal’s
Office for such system. This subsection shall not be applicable to an alarm business
which monitors, services or monitors and services an alarm system installed and
designed to protect property under the control of a person other than the alarm system
business; but the person in control of the property which the alarm system is designed
to protect shall be subject to prosecution if he permits the operation of such system
without a valid registration permit.

(b)  The person in control of the property may obtain a separate registration permit
for each alarm system or may obtain a single registration permit for all alarm systems
on so much of one (1) premises (single address) that it is under the control of the
applicant for a registration permit, except that one (1) registration permit shall not allow
the operation of both holdup and burglar alarms. If both holdup and burglar alarms are
operated on one (1) premises, a single permit may be obtained for all holdup alarms
on so much of the premises that is under the control of the applicant and a separate
permit for all burglar alarms on the premises under the control of the applicant.

(c) For the purposes of the fee set out in the above section, an alarm system shall
mean and include all alarms operated under one (1) registration permit. The fee for
registration issued pursuant to this article shall be twenty dollars ($20.00); Renewable
annually. Each registration permit issued in accordance with this article shall be valid
until such time that the control of the property is transferred from the permit holder.
Upon such transfer of control of the property, a new permit shall be obtained.
Registration permits are personally issued and are not transferable. The registration
holder for an alarm system shall keep such permit at the alarm site and shall produce
such permit for inspection upon the request of the Fire Marshal or any member of the
police department.

Sec. 10-118. Registration application; issuance of registration permit

A person having control over the property, on which the alarm system is to be installed
and operated, shall make application for a registration permit for the operation of an
alarm system. Such applications shall be made in writing to the Fire Marshal’s Office
on a form designated by the city for that purpose. On such application, the applicant
shall set forth:

(1)  The name, address and telephone number of each person in control of the
property.

(2)  The street address of the property on which the alarm system is to be installed
or operated.

13



(8)  Any business name used for the prem|ses on which the alarm is to be installed
and operated. .

" (4)" © Whether the alarm system or sy'stems are-or are not local alarms, and whether
the alarm system(s) are desigried to give notice of burglary, holdup, fire, or other type
of emergency.

(5) The name of the person or alarm system business that W|II install the alarm
system.

(6) The names and telephone numbers of at least two (2) persons or- of an alarm
system bus_iness that is able and has agreed to:

a Hecelve notification any time™* -

b. Come to the alarm site wrth:n thnty (30) minutes after receiving a request
from a member of the fire department to do'so; and grant.access to the alarm site, and
deactivate the alarm system if such becomes necessary; or the name and telephone
number of an alarm system business which is able and has agreed to receive calls at
any time and give the fire department the names of persons listed with the company
as set out in 1. and 2. and as stipulated'in N.F.P.A. 72. below,if: :

1. The permlt holder -has given the.alarm system business .the name and
telephone numbers of at least two (2) persons who are able:and,have agreed to
receive notification at any time; to come to the alarm site within thirty (30) minutes after
receiving a request from a member of the fire department or Fire Marshal, to do so;
and to grant access to the alarm s:te and deactlvate the alarm if necessary.

2. The app[[cant agrees that he WI|| whenever a person llsted with the alarm
company pursuant to 1. above is unwilling or unable to perform the duties set out, give
the alarm business the name and telephone number of.another person who is willing
to perform the duties so that at least two (2) persons are able and willing to perform
such duties that arelistéd with the ‘alarm system business at all times; and

3. The registration permit holder has authorized the alarm system business to
provide the names listed with that business pursuant to 1. and 2. above to the fire
department whenever the department has requested that information in order to obtain
assistance after an alarm has been actlvated -

' !
7) Any other mformatlon deemed by the Flre Marshal or hls designee as
necessary. » .

o

The person in control of the property on which an alarm syétem is instalied shall

1) Ensure that any person listed with the fire departrhent pursuant to the
registration process is able to:

14



a. Receive naotification at any time

b. Come to the alarm site within thirty (30) minutes after receiving a request
from a member of the police department to do so; and

C. Grant access to the alarm site, and deactivate the alarm system if such
becomes necessary.

2) Train all persons who may activate the alarm system in the proper operation of
the alarm system.

The person in control of the property on which an alarm system is installed shall
ensure that all information supplied on the original registration permit is current. Any
changes or modifications (such as new employees or persons to notify in case of
alarm activation) must be made in writing within seventy-two (72) hours of the change

Any fire alarm system that necessitates a response by a Fire Department or is a public
alarm shall be provided with standby power to automatically maintain the system in a
normal condition as stipulated in N.F.P.A. 72

Sec. 10-119. Dial alarm receiving equipment

After the enactment of this article, no automatic protection devices, known as dial
alarms or dialers, will be installed and keyed to any Fire Department emergency trunk
line.

No person shall conduct any test or demonstration of a fire alarm device or system in
the city without first obtaining permission from the fire marshal or his authorized
representative.

Sec. 10-120. Inspection

The city shall be entitled to inspect any alarm installation during regular business
hours.

- Sec. 10-121. Penalties

Violation of any subsection of this article shall be punishable by a fine not to exceed
the fine established in section 1-11 of the City Code of Ordinances.

The knowing failure of an alarm user to inspect or repair an alarm where required

herein is an offense hereunder. Each day during which such failure continues shall
constitute a separate offense.

15



The intentional installation or maintenance of an alarm not in accordance ‘with the
requirements of this article is an offense hereunder.

It is an offense to knowingly or recklessly fail to attend upon the scene of a fire alérm

activation within the time period set forth herein after actual notice has been given to
the-person designated to enter and-control.any premises. : ‘

Sec.10-122. Cost of response ™~ fl

A fee will be assessed to the registration permit holder for each response by the city to
each false-alarm-in excess of five (5) false alarms in any one calendar year. The fee
will be assessed for false alarms in the amount of $200.00 per occurrence, after five,
On October 1, of each Year, the fire marshal will furnish to the city attorney a list of
those permit.holders who have failed to pay their assessed fees for false alarms. The
city attorney will take appropriate action for collection. I -

Sec. 10-123. Exemption for charge for cost of response.

Any exemption from the above-delineated charges for re_spbnéé’s to false alarms-may
be granted upon recommendation of the Fire Mayrshal if such extenuating
circumstances are present that would merit such exemption. '

LI

Sec. 10-124, Effective date.

The requirement to register all alarm systems installed’ within' the city and other
provisions of this article.shall become effective ten (10) days after the passage of this
article. However, persons who already have alarm systems in operation shall have
until October 1, 2004, to come into compliance.

Amendment # 16 - S
Sec. 904 Alternative Automatic Fire-Extinguishing
Amend Sec. 904.3.5 at the end of paragraph to read, "If the building has no fire

alarm, a local electronic or mechanical alarm shall be required to indicate the
system has activated." -

\

16



=l
e
—(
e
||
L-
ol
-
[ — |
Y 5
&
™
A,
"y
el
hotd

L

Adopt 2000 International
Building Code

» Current 1997 = Adopt 2000
Standard Building Intematlonal Buildmg
Code - Code (IBC) .
» City ordinance Ch. 7 = , Amend CltyﬁOrdlnance
Article II Building ‘" to remove current
Code and put new in its
place.

Why?

. To match.other codes and get today: e ‘
standards when constructinga stfucture. \

» Works hand in hand Wlth 2000
International Fire Code ;
= Build safer structures 4

= Allow uniformity in construction P'-, ctice
all over the United States and be\ ond. .

~ . Bl
g
Tl




Amendment 1- Wood Shingles & _

Shakes
= Amend Sec. 1505.6, - w No wood shingles or.crmms
1507.8, &'1507.9 That wood shakes: %rés“ﬁ?lowed ¢
allows wood shingles & -~ Including singfe family \
shakes so as long asfire = 'residence ortype of fire-
proofing is applied or # proofing it shows to have
shingles that are already_ ; or apphcano appIIed ‘
fire rated. /4 Thisisah exlﬁung )
amendment e wish to
.- _ _ continue bec;%a of the
severe fire ha

= Also no staptes can be
-- - - - -- used-on composition,
shmgles :

) T T Why? - -
" u To eliminate” the use of wood shlngleszasw
roofing materials and consequently '7‘.

reducing the potential for wild fir¢
.spread,e.g., Woodway Square. Apg Fire.
= Controlling the use of staples for; Tcunng

roof shingles will bring our code i gg

compliance with TDI-wmdstorrn" ecs,

Amendment 2- Work Exempt from

. Permit
= Delete 1-10 of Sec. ~ w Permit shall; t,be,@?
105.2 required faRWwork
= Specific types of- “classified. a$

building exempt from + maintenance type

permits { with valuation less . .
7} than $1, Oﬂg ‘dollars. ;

- = The following are :

- - exempt from permit

fees and” In pections:
= US. Govenynent,_

. _Federal Age1cle‘5= R




Cont.- Exempt Permits

» Federal independent contractors .z
= State of Texas r It i
= Brazoria County b '
a School Districts (fees’ only)
= City of Pearland (fees only)

» City of Pearland EDC (fees only) -

i

e

ﬁgiig_:“‘ . ahicd
T ikmane 1

Why?

» To let the citizens and contractors know==v
that the City Code is fair and would not %
require permits for maintenance” work,

l.e., painting, ﬂoonng, etc...

-n To waive permit fees for all taxlniﬂand

governmental entities. il

Rip i

5

<,

L

r~E’

T
m S S CR
avaremazsse”

Amendment 3 - Design
Professional

= Amend Sec. 106.3.4.1 = All projedts, tt@barem
Design professional in Commerqa!,. 2
responsible charge : Educatlonal, \
Instltutlona or
i Assembly o)gcupanmes
£ I over three ries in




Cont.- Design Professional

Engineer legally reglstered in Texas
» Single and ‘two family, dwellings a'e -
exempt from this reqmrement

w Shall be designed by-an Architect Opeses===¢

Gives specifics on when: plans have to be’
stamped by an Archltect or Englneer

Amendment 5 - Permlt/Plan-
checking fees -
= Amend Sec. 108.2 » When the value:

established by the f" s Such fee sh ) equal

governing authority ~ to one-half! of the *
' ) buﬂdlng’pe_‘ filt fee as

Schedule of permit exceeds $1;000 and aZz
fees - .z plan is reqtilred to be \

= States that permit /-submitted-fees shall /
fees shall be #1 be paid.

= o




Why?

» Establish that permit fees are requwed::.m
based on percentage of total bulldlng
valuation ($), for example: -

= $100,000 valuation =,$460 fees

» Thru 500,000 valuation = add
$3/thousand

s Over 500,000 valuation = addw Hea
$2/thousand

= Moving Petmit = $100
= Demolition Permit’=: $50 !

s
—

"«-'—""'

'T e Bﬂm
Wiz i,

L

Amendment 6 - Violations

a Remove entire sec. = Add to reference Sec~=p
108.3 Work -1l of Cltya 2
commencing before ’ " Ordinance.- \

permit issuance

"y st ,,_
l e

1 g
Why?
= To follow the City Ordinance forimes ons==g
Code Violations. - 1

n Establish that there ar;e consequences for
any and all code Infractlons X -

b
QT Py .:-vm;-f




Amendment 7 - Use & Occupancy

= Amend Sec, 110.1 Use & [ Addtoendufparagmp
Ocouparcy B lld'ng mnnot'beo to lhe
I L]
- ey RRERREE
certificate of occupancy Issued ’ | H .
by the Building Offictal a ,gm‘?,'s’ ‘;1’ B"{ M 0 'dai & .
. lnstallin of equ menr. and
! "?ﬁ’:‘fv" ima)ppg by Bulk!lng
- al
Official, .IT

v

"-:.—-

L5

PPN A,

Why?'

» Makes'it clear on what is allowed;ta-bezm=sp
done prior to opening the businéss.
» Gives Building Official ‘a chance to Inspect
prior to moving inside’ ‘structure. ?‘
. Allows Fire Marshal to'verify equipment
and furniture as final set up, to cljeck for
aisle clearance, obstruction of exit doors
or any added fire hazards, based
intended use and/or occupancy

L
e

pe ‘-;.,"‘:;'T%ﬂt
e A

Amendment 8 - Board of Appeals

= Sec. 1123 ° » Sec. 112, BnW
Qualifications for Yamendment;glves 3
Board of Appeals -~ specifics of. seven
» Very generic /-members on the
i board. %l
"= Appointed | Clty
Council. '




Why?

» Gives specifics about the board and:hows===
they are appointed; 5~ regular & 2 A
alternate.

n Expands on our requi‘rements of c'Board '
of Adjustments & Appeals- that m embers
shall have knowledge and experle ce in
the technical codes. =

T 3 i

Amendment 9 - Flood Hazard

Areas
= Sec. 1612.3 Flood = Amend to add;:Elood=y
Hazard Areas Insu rance Study for ';
= Only gives specifics : Tthe City of- Pearland
according to National i‘ Flood Boun dary and
Information . Floodway Map for this
- area.

L]

s

Why?

= Gives specific mformatlon as relating,_tomw
flood data and including fiood maps for \
the City and the general area- FIRM :

e
-u;:;ﬁ T 'ﬁ““ﬂ”’ﬂ.




Amendment 10 - Footing &
Foundations

- » Sec. 18051 General . = Add to include; Allpesp
Footings and Foundations  structural members Y
" {footing & 1A
* foundationid) for -~ -
; commeruai;tructures
- shall'be approved by -
a register
professmna engsneer
= Plans shall:hg
submitted w1th
-griginal wel seals@u;m
@;f:-"applted and signed"‘“-w

Why? - -

= Provides more control for Iarger heavier==<
buildings. . ) ’\_

w Designate Engineers and Archite¢ts as the
responsible party for Commercial3,
Construction.” . T *\

It
R ol

B .
Nl |

Amendment 11 - Spacing of Studs

» Sec. 2308.9.1'Spacing = Amend to, include-20ep
of Studs A studs shal1 "be &
- -spacedamax of 18" ’\

1
'

/ on center aiid 2°X 6"/
studs shall; lae spaced !
atadistancgno

R




Why?

= This Is required to meet our Wlbnd Storme=se
Standards (110-mph).- kY

%
"‘.
)

Amendment 12 - Applicability

= Sec. 3409.2
Applicability of codes
to existing structures
prior to adoption of

» Amend to statelomermay
Structures €xisting
T prior to thé effective

: date hereof, in which

. thereis work done-
involving additions,
alterations (50% in
size or market value),
or changes'pf’
occupancy after sm

month vacapcy - o - neom

{ ﬁm ‘

codes

-5%:-‘*- —-._
Mooy R

Cont.- Applicability

= Shall be made to conform to theW
requirements of this section, or the
provisions of Sec. 3402 through 3406 for
Additions, Alteratlons or Repalrs 3; .




Why?

» Clarifies if work is major remodel,hrmnorxz-v'
_repair or maintenance.type. i

u States when to come tnto comphance thh
current codes. ;.g': ‘

Adoption of Electrical Code

» Adopt the, NBUOHB__EDS?

s Current National
Electri¢al Gode 1999

Electrical Code 1999

edition . T edition (NFPA 70). :
» City Ordinance Article  w Published by the
VII Sec. 9-153 _ - Natlonal Fqu
" Protection ¥{” -~
Association \

- = Amend CltyJ'O;dInance
Article VIT Sec. 9-153
as Adopteds_

-
- alizian -1
1 ﬁ’km'&‘k § e

s
4

Lo

Why?

a It is the fatest NFPA version of therg;m
Electrical Code. v

= This is what the state_ follows for icensed
electricians. ;- iy : ‘

= This will apply to Installatmn alteg tions,’
repairs & replacement of fi xtures all '
electrical work. i

10



Adopt Plumbing and Gas Codes

= Current Plumbing n Adopt 2000 szymer==?
Codeis 1997 Intemattonal i :
Standard Plumbing ¥ plumbing Code and

ggge.zfilt\}(\%rccll;n?nce . amend City;Ordinance
: " . Sec. 23-1Atticle I.
= Current Gas Code is
1097 Standard Gas = Adopt 2000){
Code. City Ordinance International\Fuel Gas
Sec, 23-161 Article VI Code & amend
Ordinance Sec. 23-

161 Article VI Ly ;Qm
vé:‘%ﬂf -———-—:»»« __,4 N
Why?

= All administrative adoptions and ;... s=e=y
amendments are to mold these oodes to
our systems. :
» Structure the Plumblng & Gas Co%es to
reflect the State Board (TSBPE) rgles-
5.

11



* ARTICLE IL BUILDING CODE * i

Deleting excerpt from Atticle 1I of Chapter 7 hereby amends the Code
of Ordinances of the C1ty of Pearland Texas thereof all of Section 7-13

having the following prov131on .

Sec. 7-13. Del'e!ted.

There is hereby adopted and incorporated herein by reference as the
building code of the city that certain buildingicode known as the Standard
Building Code;:1997 Edition; with revision, recommended and pubhshed by
the Southern Building Code Congress International, Inc., which code is
published in book form and incorporated herein and: ‘made a part of this
chapter A copy is on ﬁle at the c1ty secretary 5 ofﬁce

‘Substituting therefore a new Sectlon 7 13 to prov1de as follows
Sec. 7-13. Intern’ational Building Code (IB_C) Adop_ted. ;

The International Building Code, 2000 Edition, as published by the
International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted by reference and made
part of this chapter. A true and correct copy of which code is filed in the
ofﬁce of the city secretary -

4

Sec. 7-13.1. Amendments, mod:ﬁcatwns, addu‘wns, deletzons

i

The buﬂdmg code adopted in section 7 13 is modlﬂed in the
fo]lowmg resPects

Section 101.1 is hereby amended to read as follows ol e

J01.1 Title. These regulations shall be known.as the Building Code
“Of the city of Pearland, Texas, hereinafter sometimes, referred
to as “this code.” . '

VoL i



Section 101.2.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.2.1 Appendices. The provisions contained in the appendices
referenced and listed below are hereby made part of the
adopting ordinance:

Appendix-A “Employee Qualification”
Appendix-B “Board of Appeals”

Appendix-C “Agricultural Buildings” Group “U”
Appendix-D “Fire District”

Appendix-E  “Supplementary Accessibility”
Appendix-F “Rodent Proofing”

Appendix-G “Flood Resistant Construction”
Appendix-H “Signs”

Appendix-I  “Patio Covers”

Appendix-]  “ADA for Historic Buildings”

‘Section 101.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.4.1 Electrical. The provisions of the NFPA 70, National Electric
Code (NEC’99) as published by the National Fire Protection
Association, hereto adopted by the City, as amended, shall
apply to the installation of electrical systems, including
alterations, repairs and replacement of fixtures.

Section 101.4.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.4.5 Property maintenance. The provisions of the International
Property Maintenance Code along with current edition of Life Safety
Code 2000 shall apply as the standard guide for repairs, alterations,
renovations and maintenance of all commercial oriented buildings and
appurtenances.

Deleting items 1 through 10 and adding the following statement hereby
-amends section 105.2:

105.2 Work exempt from permit. Permit shall not be required for
work classified as maintenance type, whose valuation is less than one

thousand dollars ($1,000).
The following shall be exempt from permit fees and inspections,

except as noted:

U.S. Government
Federal agencies
Federal independent contractors



State of Texas

Brazoria County

School Districts (fees only)

City of Pearland (fees'only)’ " +. * .0
City of Pearland EDC (fees only)

Section 106.3.4 (Des1gn Professmnal) is hereby amended to mclude the
followings: Lo

106.3.4.1 General. All privately funded and:public proejects that are
classified as Commercial, Educational; Institutional or Assembly type
"occupancy and three or more §tories in height or exceed five thousand
(5,000) square feet in'area, except:one and-two family dwelling- the
Designer shall be an Arch1tect or Engmeer Iegally reglstered under the
law of this state

Section 108.2 is hereby amended to mclude the fo]lowmgs
108.2 Plan—checkmg fees. When the valuat1on of the proposed
construction-exceeds $1,000 and'a plan is required fo be
subrnitted, a plan-checking fee shall be paid to the Permit
Office when plans and specifications ‘are submitted for review.
Said plan-checking fee shall be equal to one-half of the
building permit fee as set forth in City Permit Fee Schedule.

Section 108.4 is hereby amended and rewritten to include
108.3 -Violations. Any person, firm or corporation who shall violate
or fail to comply with the requirements or provisions of the
building code herein adopted shall be deemed guilty of a
misdemeanor and shall; upon conviction by a court of
competent jurisdiction, be punished as provided in section 1-11
of the Code of Ordinances of the city of Pearland.

ay " v

Adding a new last sentence as follows hereby amends section 110.1:

110.1. Use and Occupancy. For the purpose of this section, the
moving of furniture or other personal property. iteris into a
property prior to issuarice of a certificate’ of occupancy shall
constitute the occupancy or use of the property..Such act is
hereby prohibited, unless authorized by the Building Official.



Section 112.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

112.3 Qualifications for Board of Appeals. The Board of
Adjustment and Appeals shall consist of seven members.
Such board members shall be composed of individuals with
knowledge and experience in the technical codes, such as
design professionals, contractors, building industry
representatives and licensed electrical/mechanical/plumbing
trades men. In addition to its regular members, the Board shall
also consist of two alternate members, one at large from the
building industry and another one at large from the public. All
board members shall be appointed by the city council. A board
member shall not act on a case in which he or she has a
personal or financial interest.

Section 903.2.8 is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.2.8 Group R. All “R-1 to R-4” occupancy type (apartments,
etc.) regardless of number of units or story height shall be
fully sprinklered, including balcony, patios and porches. Only
Single Family Residencies are exempt from this requirement.

Section 903.2.10 is hereby amended and revised to read:

903.2.10 Group S. All storage facilities (S-1/S-2) that are 5,000sq.ft
or more shall be fully sprinklered- regardless of the fire area and
aggregate floor area.

Section 907.2.11 is hereby amended and exception deleted.

907.2.11 Special Amusement Buildings. Amend to read that all
Assembly Buildings with 300 or more occupants shall be required to
install an Emergency Voice Alarm Evacuation (Evac) System.
Installations shall be in accordance with NFPA-72.

Section 907.2.11.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:
007.2.11.1 Alarm System. Where required, shall be installed per

NFPA-72 standards and monitored by off premise central station.
System shall also have occupant notification throughout the building.



Section 1004.2.1 is hereby revised to read as follows: . .
1004.2.1 Exit Access Doorways Required.

All Business/Mercantile occupant type with more than 501t

travel distance to exit doorway shall be equipped with two means of

egress that are remotely separated (not on same plane)- with the door

swinging in the direction of egress.

Sections 1505.6, 1507.8, 1507.9 are hereby amended and rewritten to read:

Wood Shingles and Shakes: No wood shingles or shakes shall be
used in the construction of any structure. All plans shall indicate the
roofing materials to be used. Additionally, composition shingles may
not be secured with staples.

Sections 1612.3. is hereby amended to read as follows:

1612.3 Flood Hazard Areas: _

The Flood Insurance Study for the City of Pearland, Texas, as
amended or revised, with accompanying Flood Insurance Rate Map
(FIRM) and Flood Boundary and Floodway Map (FBFM), including
related supporting data and revisions thereto, is hereby adopted by
reference and declared to be a part of this section.

Sections 1805.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1805.1 Footing and Foundations:

All structural members (footing & foundations) for commercial
structures shall be approved by a registered professional engineer.
Plans shall be submitted with original wet seals applied and signed.

Sections 2308.9.1 is hereby amended to include:

2308.9.1 Spacing of Studs:

Two inches by four inches (2”x4”) studs shall be spaced a maximum
of sixteen inches (16”) on center, and two inch by six-inch (2”x6”)
studs shall be spaced at a distance no greater than twenty-four inch
(24”) on center O.C. g

Sections 3409.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

3409.2 Applicability: -
Structures existing prior to the effective date hereof, in which there is
work involved additions, alterations (50% of size or market value), or



changes of occupancy, shall be made to conform to the requirements
of this section or the provisions of Sections 3402 through 3406 for
Additions, Alterations or Repairs.



* ARTICLE 1. PLUMBING CODE

1=
i

Deleting excerpt from Articlé T'of Chap'ter 23 hereby amends the
Code of Ordinances of the City of Pearland, Texas, thereof all of Sect 23-1
having provision for SBCCI’97 Plumbing Code is deleted:

Substituting therefore a new Section 23-1I to provide as follows:
Sec. 23-1. fntemaiional ﬁlumbing'Code (IPC) Adopied.

The International Plumbing Code, 2000 Edition, as published by the
International Code Council, Iic., is hereby-adopted by reference and made
part of this chapter. Provided, however, in the event of conflict between the
International Plumbing Code and the Examination Plumbirig Code (state
rules) and Study Guide, the- state rules shall govern. A true and correct copy
of which codé is filed in the office of the city secretary.

The Code of Ordinances of the City of Pearland, Texas, is hereby
further amended by deleting from Article I of Chapter 23, thereof all of
Section.23-1.1 whlch prov1des as follows '

Sec. 23-1.1. Amendments; modifications; dddit'ioﬁs,: deletions.

The plumbing code adopted in sectlon 23- 1 is modlﬁed in the
following respects: '

Section 106.6.2 is hereby aménded to redd as follows:

106.6.2 Fees. The fees for all plumbing work shall from time to time
be established by resolution of city council; and a fee schedule shall
be kept in the office of the ¢ity secrétary.

Section 106.6.3 is hereby adopted to read as'follows:
- 106.6. 3 Refunds. "The Building | Official shall authonze the refunding
of fees where the full amount of : any fee paid hereunder was’

erroneously paid or collected !

Section 108.4 is hereby deleted in its entirety and rewritten to read:



108.4 Violations. Any person, firm or corporation who shall violate
or fail to comply with the requirements or provisions of the plumbing
code herein adopted shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and
shall, upon conviction by a court of competent jurisdiction, be
punished as provided in section 1-11 of the Code of Ordinances of the
city.

Section 109.2 is hereby deleted and replaced with the following:

109.2 Board of Appeal. The construction board of adjustment and
appeals as set forth in Sec. 112.3 of the Building Code (amended)
shall also serve as the plumbing board of appeals.

Section 305.6.1is hereby adopted to read as follows:

305.6.1 Building sewers. All sewer pipes including ones connected to
private sewage disposal systems shall be buried in trenches that is 127
wide by 12” deep (minimum) at all points below finished grade.

Section 702.2 is hereby adopted to read as follows:

702.2 Drain Pipes. Building sewer piping shall be a minimum of 47
inches and conform to one of the standards listed in Table 702.1 —
702.4. Six (6”) inches and larger sewer pipes may be SDR 35 or
better.

Section 903.1is hereby adopted to read as follows:

903.1 Stack Required. Every building shall have a minimum of a
three (3”) inch main vent that is either a vent stack or stack vent. Such
vent shall run undiminished in size and directly as possible from the
building drain through to the open air, extending at least six (6”)
inches above the roof lowest elevation.

Section 904.1 is hereby adopted to read as follows:
904.1 Roof Extension. All open vent pipes that extend through a roof
shall be terminated at least 6 inches above the roof, except that where

a roof is to be used for any purpose other than weather protection, the
vent extension shall be run at least 7ft (2134 mm) above the roof.

Section 907.1 is hereby adopted to read as follows:



907.1 Individual Vent. The minimum required size of vent pipes
shall be at least 65% of the required diameter of the drain it serves.
Vents shall not be less than 1-1/2” inches in diameter. Vents
exceeding 40ft in developed length shall be increased by one pipe size
for the entire length of vent pipe.



ARTICLE VI. GAS CODE

Deleting excerpt from Article VI of Chapter 23 hereby amends the
Code of Ordinances of the City of Pearland, Texas, thereof all of Section 23-
161 having provision for SBCCI’97 Gas Code is deleted:

Substituting therefore a new Section 23-161 to provide as follows:
Sec. 23-161. International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC) Adopted.

The International Fuel Gas Code, 2000 Edition, as published by the
International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted by reference and made
part of this chapter. Provided, however, in the event of conflict between the
International Fuel Gas Code and the Examination Plumbing Code (state
rules) and Study Guide, the state rules shall govern. A true and correct copy
of which code is filed in the office of the city secretary.

The Code of Ordinances of the City of Pearland, Texas, is hereby
further amended by deleting from Article I of Chapter 23, thereof all of
Section 23-161 which provides as follows:

Sec. 23-161. Amendments; modifications; additions; deletions.

The gas code adopted in section 23-161 is modified in the following
respects:

Section 101.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title.. These regulations shall be known as the Fuel Gas
Code of the City of Pearland, Texas, hereinafter sometimes referred to as
“this code.”

Section 106.5.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
106.5.2 Fees. The fees for all gas plumbing work shall from

time to time be established by resolution of city council; and a
fee schedule shall be kept in the office of the city secretary.



Section 106.5.3 is hereby adopted to read as follows:

106.6.3 Refunds.’ The Building Official shall authorize the
refunding of fees where the full amount of any fee paid
hereunder was erroneously paid or collected.

Section 108.4 is hefeby deleted in its pnfirétj hr;d qéWrittg:p‘tb read:

108.4 Violations. Any person, firm or corporation who shall violate
or fail to comply with the requirements or provisions of the gas
plumbing code herein adopted shall be deemed gullty ofa
misdemeanor and shall, upen conviction.by a,court of competent
jurisdiction, be punlshed as provided in ‘section 1-11 of the Code of
Ordinances of the city.

Section 109.2 is hereby deleted and,replaéf::dlwith the following:

.109.2. Board of Appeal. The. cbnétructidﬁ board of adj‘ustthent
and appeals as set forth in Sec 112.3 of the Building Code
(amended) shall also serve as the gas plumblng board of
appeals. C e :



ARTICLE III. MECHANICAL CODE

Deleting excerpt from Article III of Chapter 7 hereby amends the
Code of Ordinances of the City of Pearland, Texas, thereof all of Section 7-
51. having provision for SBCCI’'97 Standard Mechanical Code is deleted:

Substituting therefore a new Section 7-51 to provide as follows:
Sec. 7-51. International Mechanical Code (IMC) Adopted.

The International Mechanical Code, 2000 Edition, as published by the
International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted by reference and made
part of this chapter. Provided, however, in the event of conflict between the
International Mechanical Code and State Energy Conservation Code (state
rules) the state rules shall govern. A true and correct copy of which code is
filed in the office of the city secretary.

The Code of Ordinances of the City of Pearland, Texas, is hereby
further amended by deleting from Article I of Chapter 23, thereof all of
Section 23-161 which provides as follows:

Sec. 7-51.1. Amendments; modifications; additions; deletions.

The mechanical code adopted in section 7-51 is modified in the
following respects:

Section 101.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Mechanical
Code of the City of Pearland, Texas, hereinafter sometimes referred to as
“this code.”

Section 106.5.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
106.5.2 Fees. The fees for permits required hereunder shall from time

to time be established by resolution of city council; and a fee schedule
shall be kept in the office of the city secretary.



Section 106.5.3 is hereby adopted to read as follows:

106.5.3 Refunds. Thé Building Official shall authorize the.refunding
of fees where the full amount of any fee paid hereunder was
erroneously paid or collected. v o

Section 108.4 is hereby deleted in its entirety and rewrittén to read:

108.4 Violations. Any person, firm.or corporation-who shall violate
or fail to comply with.the requirements or provisions:of any section or
subdivision of the mechanical code.adopted by this article shall be
deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and shall, upon conviction by a court
of competent jurisdiction, shall be fined not less than twenty-five
dollars ($25.00) nor more than two hundred dollars ($200.00) for each
offense; and each and every day that such violation continues shall
constitute a separate offense.

Section 109.2 is hereby deleted and replaced with the following:

109.2 Board of Appeal: The construction board of
adjustment and appeals as set forth in Sec. 112.3 of the Building Code
(amended) shall also serve as the Mechanical board of appeals.

Section 202 (Definitions) is hereby amended to include the following:

(a)

(b)

(c)

Whenever the terms “local governing body” or “chief
appointing authority” or “administrative authority” or
“appropriate authority of the jurisdiction” are used in the code
adopted by this article, they shall be construed to mean the City
council of the City of Pearland, Texas.

Whenever the term “department of law” is used in the code
adopted by this article, it shall be construed to mean the city
attorney of this city.

Whenever the term “mechanical official” is used in the code
adopted by this article, it shall mean the city building inspector
or his duly authorized deputy or assistants or any officer of the
city designated by the city council having the duty to enforce
the mechanical regulations of the city.



Section 606.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

606.1 Controls Required. All mechanical systems over 2000
cfm capacity shall be equipped with smoke/duct detectors on
the supply side of the system. Also, if the system capacity is
over 15,000cfm, smoke/duct detectors shall be required on
both (supply and return) sides of the system to eliminate
smoke travel. If the required control is connected to building
alarm system, activation shall create a general alarm.



PLANNING AND ZONING COMMISSION

AGENDA OF A REGULAR MEETING FOR THE PLANNING AND ZONING
COMMISSION OF THE CITY OF PEARLAND, TEXAS, TO BE HELD ON
JUNE 7, 2004 AT 6:30 P.M., IN THE COUNCIL CHAMBERS OF CITY HALL,
3519 LIBERTY DRIVE, PEARLAND, TEXAS

I CALL TO ORDER

IL NEW BUSINESS

A. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION - Remove from table the
Adoption of the 2000 International Building Code, Fire Code and Safety Code.

B. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION —Adoption of the 2000
International Building Code, Fire Code and Safety Code.

C. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION - Final Right-of-Way plat for
Shadow Creek Ranch West Clear Lake Loop, Portions of South Clear Lake Loop
and Kingsley Drive, and Trinity Bay Drive, 25.425 acres being out of the H.T.
&B.R.R. Co. Survey, Section 82, Abstract 565, The S.G. Haynie Survey, Abstract
212 and the H.T. & B.R.R. Co. Survey, Section 83, Abstract 305, City of
Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas

D. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION - Final Plat of Creekside
Section Two, 26.751 acres out of the D.H.M. Hunter Survey, Abstract 76, City of
Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas

E. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION - Partial Replat of Creekside
Section One Block 3, 3.113 acres being all of Reserve B and Lots 1 through 15 of
Block 3 of the Amending Plat of Creekside Section One Recorded in Volume 24,
Pages 9 & 10 of the Brazoria County Map Records and Being out of the H.T. &
B.R.R. Co. Survey, Section One Abstract 233 and th eD.H.M. Hunter Survey,
Abstract 76. City of Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas

F. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION —Preliminary Plat of O’Reilly
Pearland, being a subdivision of 0.8609 acre of land in Section 17 of the H.T. &
B.R.R. Co. Survey, Abstract No. 242, In the City of Pearland, Brazoria County,
Texas ; Being Tract 17 of Westchester Estates, and unrecorded subdivision in the
City of Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas

Page 1 of 2 - P&Z AGENDA



“.‘I
Y

PLANNING AND ZONING COMMISSION

G. CONSIDERATION & POSSIBLE ACTION - Final Plat of Reyes Estates,
a subdivision of 2.2510 acres of land out of a 60.13 acre tract in the Allison —
Richey Gulf Coast Home Company’s Suburban gardens, H.T. & B.R.R. Co.
Survey, Section 10, Abstract 505, City of Pearland, Brazoria County, Texas

H. DISCUSSION ITEM - Regarding a proposed 10.407 acre Planned Unit
Development (PUD), located at the north west corner of Halik Road and SH 35.

NEXT MEETING DATES: June 21, 2004 — JPH & Regular P & Z
July 19,2004 - JPH & Regular P & Z

III. ADJOURNMENT

This site is accessible to disabled individuals, For special assistance, please call
Young Lorfing at 281-652-1655 prior to the meeting so that appropriate
arrangements can be made.

Page 2 of 2 — P&Z AGENDA



[=4=1¢ L=2= 4 A e UV wdlm'd b "YWl T T A

MHY &8 cydy4 ¥goioy rK LI T Vvr reaceang

FINAL PLAT SUBMITTAL APPLICATION

DATE FILED; P&Z MEETING DATE:;___|J l 1ot
SUBDIVISION NAMELLOCATION:___ /ZayeS Lo rg4os

Lot(s); / , Block(s): / . Reserve(s): o
PRIMARY CONTACT(Print or Type),___/2447¢ Loyesr Phone:_ £335-3¢26835
MAILING ADDRESS: 7930 Glernd  Bpaiecs-

Aovsros T 7206/
OWNER NAME(Frint or Type): /€4F?4é'-'_ < ﬂé‘r V=S Phone;_&32 3v7-6333
MAILING ADDRESS: 7920 (/en) o diric

2ous gt 7T EXAS >206 /

AGENT'S NAME(Print or Type): Phone:
MAILING ADDRESS:

T;?ouowing required documents must accompany the final plat when submitted to staff:

5;/22 Folded Prints of Final Plat & Gompleted Checklist
2 sets of Final Plat mylars Current Title Report

(3 sets [ ETJ) a/or\fériance Request(s) in Letter Form
ﬂ\l Show Approval of Construction Plans ti/c:vszrtiﬂet:! Tax Certificates (no taxes can be due

\Show Approval of Drainage Report lajﬁal Plat Staff Review Mark-Up
how Approval of Traffic Impact Analysis Application fee ($400 plus $4 per Iot
Q Park Fees (if required) or $25 per acre) Y4 5¢,. 5.8

NOTE: ALL REQUIRED DOCUMENTS MUST BE SUBMITTED TO ENGINEEF_IING DEPT.
STAFF BY 9 AM. THE MONDAY PRECEEDING THE PLANNING AND ZONING
COMMISSION MEETING, INCOMPLETE SUBMITTALS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED.

The undersigned hereby request approval by the Planning and Zoning Commission of the

above idenwwi ;at. /
Signature: /J e;/// - Signature:

' (Own

) _
Fee: § q’% 7 Date Paid:_[L’J;Q‘[' Receipt No.;

(Agent)




Lata Krishnarao Ta: Theresa Grahmann/COP @ci.pearland.tx.us, Trish
06/01/2004 10:21 AM o Broussard/COP @ci.pearland.tx.us
Subject: New item for June 7th meetingof P & Z

Please add this to the P & Z agenda of June 7th.
| will have the report for the package ready by Thursday noon.

Discussion Item - Regarding a proposed 10.407 acre Planned Unit Development (PUD), located at the
north west corner of Halik Road and SH 35.
Thanks.

Lata Krishnarao, AICP
Planning Manager
City of Pearland

(281) 652-1635



Lata Krishnarao To: Trish Broussard/COP @ci.pearland.tx.us
cc:
05/25/, 2004,_1 1,'53 AM Subject: ltems for P & Z agenda of June 7, 2004

Trish,
Could you please add these items. Thanks.

1 Remove Building and Life safety codes from the Table
2 Adoption of Building and Life safety codes

Lata Krishnarao, AICP
Planning Manager
City of Peartand

(281) 652-1635

-

2



To Be Published in the
PEARLAND REPORTER-NEWS
Wednesday, May 26, 2004,
and

Wednesday, June 2, 2004

NOTICE OF A JOINT PUBLIC HEARING OF THE CITY COUNCIL
AND
THE PLANNING AND ZONING COMMISSION

OF THE CITY OF PEARLAND, TEXAS

2004 COMPREHENSIVE PLAN UPDATE

Notice is hereby given that on June 14, 2004, at 6:30 p.m., the City Council and Planning
and Zoning Commission of the City of Pearland, in Brazoria, Harris and Fort Bend
Counties, Texas, will conduct a joint public hearing in the Council Chambers of City Hall,
3519 Liberty Drive, Pearland, Texas, on the request of the City of Pearland, for an
amendment to the Comprehensive Plan of said City, including, but not limited to, updates
regarding housing guidance, future land use, and community image guidelines.

At said hearing all interested parties shall have the right and opportunity to appear and be
heard on the subject.

Theresa Grahmann

Theresa Grahmann
Planner |



R A

fr—————r—— —————————
N S—

L T 0]

Noda Toca road orNa At spedt PUArprar

HIESSs S anan =g Fo) T8 AR ¥ ‘
QEMW_QMMJ%
|

| 2004 Cocsparhietie Plam o Cranudors Askid e
L Duentan Sdes s D

—k

m EQ - \Qm‘ﬁé Q untir Sty e e

5

' B A a5 é NOUS 0y q/uo’du
| MMM_L%MMN‘&M e it

l (NS

ﬁ\:? Oro doss . B4 R\GerChy Proxlon.

L NON Seovagamis - Kb nudy Ao b by ona - - G Ads G

| : - ul o wh
Ao 4 TR e~ b~
QA Vit wih, £} -
Mgy fr ke onaa he iy up.  Fotoney oner Ul Sugerb

C~rotr—

g S}S‘% ! Y\Q*an Coler koo ;fbu-"’»— = (o gmnax 0,1"-
| st — U\nﬂnﬂj_e_bb_w-' color paletiy - mpe
'I_AL DA
1(1 UM Soces e N
mﬂ_MqMLM&_m_h -

| |
}‘_»Jn&zh_\;rp_-_qw_@ﬁm”_%?u. s -



-

I

T

Ed

7

WJv \een }\A:l-l"'\‘.l‘)l“

2 ANz

S\f\?»\‘(\ (3 iinga. -

4 E

iy A ‘()ll/uan&? &,

V'\HM'A-\

- plonnag .

N -

-y

L)

b

Il

R —

9 = Tl s 4

< U0 in

| !

\
il

0bn 5 Cnpus Ftam Lo syl

—_—

()&

W

I!T
[

il




M LT
— cmﬂﬁvwz%@ﬁ?¢fﬁ%%“*

e SR,
Doy, //qu//  FRA

N

/9]
N

W,W mm/f?w/@
o im ml? /fWCWM

' & A t

A
(U e, fod) /)/aj S -

Viehnd. ¥ ph pudstundiii, Lws Jyat
\%m boen tlun ¢ M_

’Kquﬂ MpdL st
Doy pelpndisl

oo do Wwe, Msw! (p-0

@wmeMMMWWmmﬁwa

Lﬁﬁl( d ﬁwﬂﬁzw{% for TAMC R




= {1}
m
111
: 2
== |
l
|

&mmm L

A NUAL

@ ’mmM Jo_app W Jipned (i)

P i,

ﬂi) Yl Pl O/CMM

Kechiwid. 1o Mﬁmgf s

@'mw

|
S
b&wxﬂ Aode 4t I

il ol Auichin

A\l dm,l/l/lftfp o Dned . elat.

(ol M purpied. Bt Wl pe

WM he  Sndh hat o (Dt

(E) Tuul Pt Layes Pl -
0 putstundong Homs —nat hoe

LU (et




9

o
B Y

G

p L7
RO =0 uble. /L1 R

/K

7

N e,

&) /00 (Hon Wil e {alun

/

o S

By

)’K‘

"—'-1

J
4

e’

N

s

(

LW 3

é ?
— ey

%

J

e %APLLD sl lued 497 TP

u/LTqu Dhudl_(ipohdze. - VD,

e tef . Py Pd - Fhay 3

70 Kw‘una (3)

L%u dm%% i Stz

Lqui\) 1 T D 1e UWV’Z‘C}".

MW%& [op B Lewn Ao

Aol e

M M A0A CoMmMAUCL

1o Hudsdid

/ﬂ &Wt Cout

Hd - 0w - Sodn rew ol gy, Tan
L Chwua - otst Mi (unal St

l

Pt b 2aud ( aLbteat

W:ﬁﬁma ST LiC ALY

"§+m LU S O N Confpmwie d/,tzﬂéd&ﬂ/

W MU @ 4\/@;11,{

¥ K A

T\

AR %tq (bl mma%s
Il o e BN, o glass




MWWW%WW%%@#WW’“W

RO R

; 0
P T g % T =)

/) i
D Ll

o Jymfﬂ/m wFlas 4 8

o KM

7 dé7i QW ﬂm

Wﬂ% / —’WWVW WWW/‘U%




g, ING.
nt®

OFFICE, RESTAURANT

COMMERCIAL - CONVENIENCE STORE

KERRY R.

SO
—

HOSPITAL/MEDICAL

DAY CARE
MUNICIPAL i

DRILL SITE / PARK

UTILITY / IMPROVEMENTS

/
NEIGHBORHOOD / ,u"

RECREATION CENTER / PARK 1
U Lake !
|:| MULTI-FAMILY :’,
A=) [a1] soxus §750 /Ilf
A ’?SE s x 115 L5 =
f?’,f;‘ s x 11y £ T oo
P-4 c Jesans 7/ :
A3 |I| iz g o0
£~2 [E] swxte FE°©

/

gl |I| oo x 1300 /) 7 &
ﬁl’cll—l 125'x 140 ¢ /500

1

TR
g7

THIS MAP IS FOR PRESENTATION PURPOSES ONLY AND WAS PREPARED WITHOUT BENEFIT OF
AN ENVIRONMENTAL ANALYSIS OR ENGINEERING STUDY AND IS SUBJECT TO CHANGE. NO
WARRANTIES OR REPRESENTATION, EXPRESS OR IMPLIED, CONCERNING THE ACTUAL DESIGN,

-+ LOCATION, OR CHARACTER OF THE FACILITIES ILLUSTRATED ON THE MAP IS INTENDED.
ADDITIONALLY, NO WARRANTY IS MADE AS TO THE ACCURACY OF THE INFORMATION CONTAINED
HEREIN. SAID INFORMATION REPRESENTS A GRAPHIC COMPILATION OF DATUM OBTAINED FROM

MAPS, SURVEYS, AND OTHER DOCUMENTS PROVIDED TO KERRY R. GILBERT & ASSOCIATES, INC.

THE ILLUSTRATED TIRZ [MPROVEMENTS ARE SUBJECT TO CHANGE PER FINAL GOVERNMENTAL
APPROVAL. ANY SUCH CHANGE WILL NOT REQUIRE A PLANNED AMENDMENT.

Uu.T.
MEDICAL
CENTER

=._;'z¥ :.;L |
DK =
»“‘\ N,

i
‘R{‘&uirg

e 10 Drolnags
Easamant

>
<

) 5
>

ittt Giisininin) = L L
U%;mnn_um : = N

o
Z|

o

o i
=
o

=1

<

o S, . .

111 S U = — e
P 1= - ___.—___-zl__
e ROADWAY / C.R. 8 DCAA

1.8 acres

a proposecd uses map for

SHADOW CREEK RANCH

: DEV. CO., L.P. |

SHADOW CREEK RANCH

[ e e e s S R TS e e | e et
KERRY R, GILBERT & ASSOCIATES, INC. ni ™
15810 Park Ten Place 2
Suite 160 i
STALE AUGUST 18, 2003 Houston, Texcs 77084 o
ado sto 1000 KGA #03301-010 (281) 579-0340 \‘_s"‘
KERRY R: ¢




MNAIUW UKEEN AlNuI
T CLEAR. LAKE LOOP, PORTIONS

F SOUTH: CLEAR LAKE LOOP
AND KINGSLEY DRIVE, AND

TRINITY BAY DRIVE
25.425 ACRES

G OUT OF THE H.T. & B.R.R. CO. SURVLY,
SECTION 82, ABSTRAET 565, THE
. G. HAYNIE SURVEY, ABSTRACT 212 AND
He T« & B.R.R. CO. SURVEY, SECTION 835,
ABSTRACT 305, CITY OF PEARLAND,
BRAZORITA COUNTY, TEXAS

O RESERVEE
MAY, 2004

OWNERS:

ARLAND  INVESTMENTS, LIMITED PARTNERSHIP,
A NEVADA LIMITED PARTNERSHIP

BY ITS GENERAL PARTNER, M.M.L.B. CORP.

M. M. COLLINS, PRESIDENT
95 LAS VEGAS BOULEVARD S. LAS VEGAS, NEVADA 83119 PH. (702)736-615I

SHADOW CREEK RANCH DEVELOPMENT COMPANY
IMITED PARTNERSHIP, A NEVADA LIMITED PARTNERSHIP
BY ITS GENERAL PARTNER, SHADOW CREEK RANCH, INC.

GARY COOK, PRESIDENT
2947 EAST BROADWAY  PEARLAND, TEXAS

JOB NO. 1546-0202-006
ENGINEER:

LJA Engineering & Surveying, Inc. ll‘

2929 Bnarpark Drive Phone 713.953.5200
Suite 600

Fax 713.953.5026
Houston, Texas 77042-3703




0.114 4,955 LANDSCAPE / OPEN SPACE

- OI 980 42' 702 ——————— .— ————————————

FINAL PLAT OF

CREEKSIDE

SECTION TWO

20. (51 ACRES
» OUT OF THE D.H.M. HUNTER SURVEY,
\BSTRACT 76, CITY OF PEARLAND
BRAZORITA COUNTY, TEXAS

5 4 RESERVES (0.980 RC. ) 3 BLOCKS

24 SCALE: |" = 100
OWNERS:

RH OF TEXAS LIMITED PARTNERSHIP
\D HOMES OF TEXAS, INC., GENERAL PARTNER

ERNEST LOEB, VICE PRESIDENT
USTON PARKWY. N., SUITE 150 HOUSTON, TEXAS 77041  PH. (713) 856-2800

JOB NO. 1592-0102-M06

ENGINEER:
LJA Engineering & Surveying, Inc. IA

'929 Briarpark Drive Phone 713953.5200

suite 600 . Fax 713.953.5026
fouston, Texas 77042-3703

CONTACT: OMAR ESCOBAR JHEET |

OF 2




PRELIMINARY PLAT
OF

LLY PEARLAND

BDIVISION OF 0.8609 ACRE OF LAND IN SECTION 17 OF
}. RR. Co. SURVEY ABSTRACT No. 242, IN THE CITY OF
ID, BRAZORIA COUNTY, TEXAS; BEING TRACT 17 OF

R ESTATES, AN UNRECORDED SUBDIVISION IN THE CITY
OF PEARLAND, BRAZORIA COUNTY, TEXAS

1 BLOCK 1 RESTRICTED RESERVE
N DEVELOPER . L _ OWNER
Hi/Lo AUTO SUPPLY, L.P. ERWIN M. HARDCASTLE
BECKY PILAND 2311 GREEN TEE DRIVE
REAL ESTATE DEPARTMENT PEARLAND, TEXAS 77581
233 SOUTH PATTERSON . 281—484—1541

SPRINGFIELD, MISSOURI 65802
417—-862—-2674

MAY 24, 2004




DR

BIE

FINAL PLAT
REYES ESTATES

I
=

N o e
—
g

ENGINFER

SNOWDEN ENGIN R
IAME S [

SURVEYOR

SNOWDEN  ENGIN
JAME = D

i_x ll: .*.'\ I—" L *‘j-"\ !\J L' ' T 5

081 - 43— -

ENCGWDEE

DEARLAND, TS

SNOWDEE
2E0E WES TV -

vk




PARTIAL REPLAT OF

CREEKSIDE

;TION ONE BLOCK 3
. 113 ACRES

2 RESERVE "B" AND LOTS | THROUGH 15

E AMENDING PLAT OF CREEKSIDE SECTION ONE
24, PAGES 9 & |0 OF THE BRAZORIA COUNTY

IEING OUT OF THE H.T. @ B.R.R. CO. SURVEY,
ABSTRACT 233 AND THE D.H.M. HUNTER

ABSTRACT 76, CITY OF PEARLAND,

BRAZORITA COUNTY, TEXAS
| RESERVE (0. 166 AC.) | BLOCK

PARTIAL REPLAT: TO REMOVE 15’ DRAINAGE
>EMENT ALONG NORTH PROPERTY L INE

SCALE: 1" = 100’

OWNERS:
OF TEXAS LIMITED PARTNERSHIP
HOMES OF TEXAS, INC., GENERAL PARTNER

ERNEST LOEB, VICE PRESIDENT
V PARKWY. N., SUITE 150 HOUSTON, TEXAS 77041 PH. (713) 856-2800

JOB NO. 1592-0101-006

ENG | NEER:
A Engineering & Surveying, Inc. ll‘

iarpark Drive Phone 713.953.5200

0 Fax 713.953.5026
i, Texas 77042-3703

CONTACT: OMAR ESCOBAR




	PlanningScan0417
	Sharp@pearlandtx.gov_20160701_142952

